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ONTARIO 

SUPERIOR COURT OF JUSTICE 
(COMMERCIAL LIST) 

 

IN THE MATTER OF THE COMPANIES’ CREDITORS ARRANGEMENT ACT, 
R.S.C. 1985, c. C-36, AS AMENDED 

AND IN THE MATTER OF A PLAN OF COMPROMISE OR ARRANGEMENT 
OF LOYALTYONE, CO. 

FOURTH REPORT OF KSV RESTRUCTURING INC.  

JUNE 27, 2023 

1.0 Introduction 

1. Pursuant to an order (the “Initial Order”) issued by the Ontario Superior Court of 
Justice (Commercial List) (the “Court”) on March 10, 2023, LoyaltyOne, Co. (the 
“Applicant”) was granted protection under the Companies’ Creditors Arrangement 
Act, R.S.C. 1985, c. C-36, as amended (the “CCAA”), and KSV Restructuring Inc. 
(“KSV”) was appointed monitor of the Applicant (in such capacity, the “Monitor”).  The 
Initial Order also extended the CCAA stay and certain other relief to LoyaltyOne Travel 
Services Co./Cie Des Voyages LoyaltyOne, a non-applicant subsidiary of the 
Applicant (“Travel Services” and together with the Applicant, the “LoyaltyOne 
Entities”).  At a comeback hearing on March 20, 2023, the Court issued an Amended 
and Restated Initial Order (the “ARIO”). 

2. Also on March 10, 2023, the Applicant’s ultimate parent company, Loyalty Ventures 
Inc. (“LVI”), and three affiliated entities 1  (collectively, the “US Debtors”), filed 
voluntary petitions to commence proceedings (the “US Proceedings”) under Chapter 
11 of Title 11 of the United States Code (the “Bankruptcy Code”) in the United States 
Bankruptcy Court for the Southern District of Texas (the “US Court”).  The LoyaltyOne 
Entities are not debtors in the US Proceedings.   

3. The principal purpose of this proceeding (this “CCAA Proceeding”) was to create a 
stabilized environment in which the Applicant could: 

a) continue to operate in the ordinary course with the breathing space afforded by 
filing for protection under the CCAA, including to continue to operate the AIR 
MILES® Reward Program and to honour redemptions by the collectors of AIR 
MILES® reward miles in the normal course;  

 
1 The affiliated Chapter 11 debtor entities are LVI Sky Oak LLC, LVI Lux Holdings S.à r.l. and Rhombus Investments 
L.P. 

Court File No.: CV-23-00696017-00CL 
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b) secure required debtor-in-possession (“DIP”) financing from Bank of Montreal 
(“BMO” and, in such capacity, the “DIP Lender”) to fund the Applicant’s ongoing 
business and the restructuring proceedings pursuant to a US$70 million DIP 
loan facility (the “DIP Facility”); and  

c) identify and complete a going-concern sale transaction pursuant to a Court 
supervised sale and investment solicitation process (“SISP”).  In this regard, the 
Applicant entered into an asset purchase agreement with BMO, the Applicant’s 
largest customer, which provided for a purchase price of US$160 million, 
subject to certain adjustments, plus the assumption of certain liabilities, to be 
used as a “stalking horse” bid in the SISP (as amended, the “Stalking Horse 
APA”). 

4. On March 17, 2023, in connection with the US Proceedings, the US Debtors filed a 
Combined Disclosure Statement and Joint Chapter 11 Plan of Reorganization 
pursuant to Chapter 11 of the Bankruptcy Code (as applicable, the “Combined DS 
and Plan” or the “LVI Chapter 11 Plan”). Among other things, the LVI Chapter 11 
Plan provides for the establishment of a liquidating trust to pursue recoveries on 
behalf of the US Debtors’ stakeholders (the “LVI Chapter 11 Litigation Trust”). 

5. On April 27, 2023, the Combined DS and Plan was approved and confirmed by the 
US Court.  On May 1, 2023, the Court issued an order, granting certain relief sought 
by the Applicant in connection with the LVI Chapter 11 Plan, which relief was a 
condition precedent to the LVI Chapter 11 Plan becoming effective. The LVI Chapter 
11 Plan became effective on June 2, 2023. 

6. At a hearing on May 12, 2023, the Court issued: 

a) an Approval and Vesting Order (the “AVO”), among other things: 

 approving the transaction contemplated by the Stalking Horse APA (the 
“Transaction”); 

 following the Monitor’s delivery of the Monitor’s certificate substantially in 
the form attached as Schedule “A” to the AVO (the “Monitor’s 
Certificate”), transferring and vesting all of the Applicant’s right, title and 
interest in and to all of the issued and outstanding shares in the capital of 
Travel Services  to an affiliate of BMO, and all of the Applicant’s right, title 
and interest in and to the balance of the Purchased Assets (as defined in 
the Stalking Horse APA) in another BMO affiliate, in each case free and 
clear from any encumbrances, except for certain permitted 
encumbrances; 

 concurrent with or immediately following delivery of the Monitor’s 
Certificate, directing the Applicant to repay in full all obligations owing 
under the DIP Facility and discharging the corresponding DIP Lender’s 
Charge (as defined in the ARIO); 

 concurrent with or immediately following delivery of the Monitor’s 
Certificate, directing the Applicant to pay in full certain transaction fees 
owing to PJT Partners LP (“PJT”), the Applicant’s financial advisor, and 
discharging the corresponding Financial Advisor Charge (as defined in the 
ARIO); 
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b) an Assignment Order, which, among other things, following delivery of the 
Monitor’s Certificate, assigned all of the Applicant’s rights and obligations in 
respect of certain contracts to BMO; and 

c) an Ancillary Relief Order that, among other things: 

 provided that, following delivery of the Monitor’s Certificate, all of the 
existing directors and officers of the Applicant (other than certain officers 
of the Applicant who will remain employed by the Applicant upon closing) 
were deemed to resign, and authorized and empowered the Monitor to 
exercise any powers which may be properly exercised by a board of 
directors or any officers of the Applicant;  

 removed Travel Services from the purview of the Initial Order (in light of 
the sale of its shares pursuant to the Transaction); and 

 extended the stay of proceedings to July 14, 2023. 

7. The Transaction closed on June 1, 2023 (the “Closing”).  

8. The next steps in this proceeding are to: (a) seek the Court’s approval of a distribution 
of a portion of the net Transaction proceeds and the Applicant’s cash on hand at the 
time of Closing (the “Cash and Proceeds”) to the Applicant’s secured creditors; and 
(b) realize on the Applicant’s remaining assets (i.e. those that were excluded from the 
Transaction).  Accordingly, the Applicant is seeking an order authorizing one or more 
distributions of the Cash and Proceeds, subject to the terms of the proposed order, 
and an extension of the stay of proceedings for approximately 12 months in order to 
provide the Applicant, under the oversight and supervision of the Monitor, with 
additional time to advance the realization on its remaining assets, including certain 
litigation claims that will require significant time to evaluate and pursue (if the 
Applicant determines to do so). 

1.1 Purposes of this Report  

1. The purposes of this report (the “Fourth Report”) are to: 

a) provide background information regarding the Applicant and these proceedings; 

b) discuss a proposed distribution of Cash and Proceeds to the Credit Facility 
Agent on behalf of the Credit Agreement Lenders (each as defined below);  

c) summarize a proposed transaction (the “Remaining FF&E Transaction”) 
between the Applicant and First Gulf KEC Development Limited (“First Gulf”), 
the Applicant’s landlord at its leased head office premises at 351 King Street, 
Toronto (the “Toronto Office”), for substantially all of the remaining furniture, 
fixtures and equipment (the “Remaining FF&E”) located at those premises;  

d) set out the Monitor’s basis for its support of an extension of the stay of 
proceedings from July 14, 2023 to June 28, 2024; 
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e) summarize the fees and disbursements of the Monitor incurred from the 
commencement of this CCAA Proceeding to May 31, 2023, as well as those of 
its legal counsel, Goodmans LLP (“Goodmans”), incurred from the 
commencement of this CCAA Proceeding to June 6, 2023, each as described 
further in the Fee Affidavits (as defined below); and 

f) recommend the Court issue the following Orders:  

i. an Order (the “Stay Extension and Distribution Order”), among other 
things: 

 authorizing the Applicant, at such time or times as it determines 
appropriate, to make one or more distributions to the Credit Facility 
Agent of Cash and Proceeds held by the Applicant, subject to the 
terms set out in the proposed order;  

 providing that the Monitor shall not incur any liability in connection 
with the distributions contemplated in the proposed order, whether 
in its personal capacity or in its capacity as Monitor; 

 reducing the charge on the Property (as defined in the ARIO) in 
favour of the Applicant’s directors and officers to secure the 
Applicant’s indemnity obligations in the ARIO (the “Directors’ 
Charge”) from $15.409 million to $2 million;  

 terminating the charge on the Property for the benefit of the 
participants of the two employee retention plans offered to the 
Applicant’s former employees (the “Employee Retention Plans”) in 
the maximum aggregate amount of $5.35 million (the “ERP 
Charge”); 

 extending the stay of proceedings to June 28, 2024; 

 approving the fees and disbursements of the Monitor and its legal 
counsel as described in this Fourth Report and the Fee Affidavits; 
and 

 approving the Pre-Filing Report of the Proposed Monitor dated 
March 10, 2023, the First Report of the Monitor dated March 16, 
2023, the Second Report of the Monitor dated April 27, 2023, the 
Third Report of the Monitor dated May 8, 2023, (the “Third Report”) 
and the Fourth Report (collectively, the “Reports”), and the activities 
and conduct of the Monitor set out in such reports; and 

ii. an Approval and Vesting Order (“FF&E AVO”), among other things: 

 approving the Remaining FF&E Transaction; and 

 following receipt by the Applicant of the FF&E Payment (as defined 
below), vesting all of the Applicant’s right, title and interest in and to 
the Remaining FF&E in First Gulf free and clear of any 
encumbrances. 
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1.2 Restrictions 

1. In preparing this Fourth Report, the Monitor has relied upon the Applicant’s audited 
and unaudited financial information, books and records and discussions with the 
Applicant’s legal counsel (Cassels Brock & Blackwell LLP) and restructuring advisor 
(Alvarez & Marsal Inc. (“A&M”)). 

2. The Monitor has not audited or otherwise attempted to verify the accuracy or 
completeness of the financial information relied on to prepare this Fourth Report in a 
manner that complies with Canadian Auditing Standards (“CAS”) pursuant to the 
Chartered Professional Accountants of Canada Handbook and, accordingly, the 
Monitor expresses no opinion or other form of assurance contemplated under the CAS 
in respect of such information.  Any party wishing to place reliance on the financial 
information should perform its own diligence.    

3. Future oriented financial information relied upon in this Fourth Report is based upon 
the Applicant’s assumptions regarding future events; actual results achieved may vary 
from this information and these variations may be material.  The Monitor expresses 
no opinion or other form of assurance on whether these results will be achieved. 

1.3 Currency 

1. Unless otherwise noted, all currency references in this Fourth Report are in Canadian 
dollars. 

2.0 Background 

2.1 Overview 

1. Prior to the Closing, the LoyaltyOne Entities operated the marketing program known 
as the AIR MILES® Reward Program (the “AIR MILES® Reward Program” or “AIR 
MILES®”).  The Applicant is a Nova Scotia unlimited liability company that is 
headquartered in Toronto, Ontario. 

2.2 Transaction 

1. Pursuant to the terms of the SISP, on April 28, 2023, the Applicant notified BMO that 
the Stalking Horse APA was the successful bid under the SISP.  Following the 
selection of the successful bid, the Stalking Horse APA was amended to, among other 
things: (i) address certain immaterial drafting inconsistencies and defined terms; (ii) 
amend the excluded contracts list; (iii) provide for a revised process for the 
identification of additional excluded contracts; and (iv) include certain provisions 
relating to Transition Employees (as defined below).  The amendment also provided 
for an increase to the cash consideration provided under the Stalking Horse APA from 
US$160 million to US$160,259,861. 

2. On May 31, 2023, the Applicant and BMO entered into a second amendment to the 
Stalking Horse APA, among other things, clarifying the ownership and use of certain 
intellectual property assets and confirming the process for allocation of hard copy 
records post-closing between the Applicant and BMO.  
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3. The Transaction closed on June 1, 2023, and in accordance with the amended 
Stalking Horse APA, BMO paid the cash purchase price of US$160,259,861 as 
follows: (i) US$77,175,584 to the Applicant; (ii) US$73,084,277 to the DIP Lender to 
fully repay the DIP Facility and discharge the DIP Lender’s Charge; and (iii) US$10 
million into an escrow account maintained by the Monitor as escrow agent, to be held 
in escrow pending the calculation of the purchase price adjustments under the 
Transaction (the “Adjustment Escrow Amount”).  The process for determination of 
the final purchase price is set out in the Stalking Horse APA and provides for BMO to 
deliver a draft closing statement setting out BMO’s calculation of certain purchase 
price adjustment components not later than 90 calendar days after the closing, being 
August 30, 2023.  To the extent the parties are unable to resolve any disputes relating 
to the proposed purchase price adjustments, the Stalking Horse APA provides for the 
resolution of disputes by the Monitor or, in certain circumstances, by an arbitrator.  
Under the terms of the Stalking Horse APA, the maximum amount of potential 
purchase price adjustments is US$10 million, being the Adjustment Escrow Amount. 

4. Upon Closing, the Applicant’s existing directors and most officers resigned, the 
Applicant discontinued its operations and substantially all of the Applicant’s 
employees became employees of BMO, except for: (i) 20 employees of the Applicant 
who remained with the Applicant until June 18, 2023 in order to assist the Applicant 
with certain necessary corporate and windup matters (the “Transition Employees”); 
and (ii) two employees of the Applicant that did not accept their offer of employment 
from BMO and were terminated effective on May 31, 2023.  On June 19, 2023, after 
completing the transition matters, the Transition Employees became employees of 
BMO.  

5. Since Closing, the Applicant has worked closely with the Monitor to address the 
allocation of assets between the parties including (i) ensuring that the Monitor has 
access to terminated employee files in order to respond to employment related 
inquiries; and (ii) preparing, under the supervision of the Monitor, an index of all of the 
hard copy records to facilitate the division of the records between the Applicant and 
BMO consistent with the terms of the Stalking Horse APA.  

6. All Court materials filed in this proceeding, including the Monitor’s reports, are 
available on the Monitor’s website at the following link: 
https://www.ksvadvisory.com/experience/case/loyaltyone. 

7. All US Court materials filed in the US Proceedings are available at the following link: 
https://cases.ra.kroll.com/LVI/Home-Index. 

2.3 Secured Lenders 

2.3.1 BMO 

1. As referenced above, BMO was the DIP Lender in this CCAA Proceeding.  Pursuant 
to the terms of the AVO, on Closing, all obligations owing under the DIP Facility were 
repaid and the corresponding DIP Lender’s Charge was discharged. 
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2.3.2 Credit Agreement Lenders 

1. LVI, Brand Loyalty Group B.V., Brand Loyalty Holding B.V. and Brand Loyalty 
International B.V. (collectively, the “Borrowers”), a group of lenders (collectively, the 
“Credit Agreement Lenders”) and Bank of America N.A., as administrative agent 
(the “Credit Facility Agent”), entered into a credit agreement dated as of November 
3, 2021 (as amended, the “Credit Agreement”), whereby the Credit Agreement 
Lenders established credit facilities for the Borrowers.  Certain of LVI’s subsidiaries, 
including the Applicant (but not Travel Services), are guarantors under the Credit 
Agreement (collectively, the “Guarantors”).  

2. Pursuant to the terms of the Credit Agreement, the Credit Agreement Lenders made 
available the following facilities (collectively, the “Credit Facilities”): (i) a US$175 
million Term Loan A facility for the Borrowers due November 3, 2026; (ii) a US$500 
million Term Loan B facility for the Borrowers due November 3, 2027; and (iii) a 
revolving credit facility in the maximum amount of US$150 million for LVI due 
November 3, 2026.  As of March 9, 2023 (i.e. the day prior to the commencement of 
this CCAA Proceeding), there was approximately US$656 million of principal 
estimated to be outstanding under the Credit Facilities.  Interest and costs have 
continued to accrue since that date. At the commencement of these proceedings, the 
Applicant entered into a support agreement dated March 10, 2023 (the “Transaction 
Support Agreement”) with certain of the Credit Agreement Lenders (with the lenders 
who subsequently signed, the “Consenting Lenders”) and the Credit Facility Agent 
(collectively, with the Consenting Lenders, the “Consenting Stakeholders”). 

3. The obligations under the Credit Agreement were secured by, among other things, a 
first priority security interest in all present and after-acquired personal property of the 
Borrowers and the Guarantors, including the Applicant (including shares and other 
equity interests owned by them), excluding the Excluded Property (as defined in the 
Credit Agreement) (the “Credit Agreement Collateral”).  

4. As detailed in the Monitor’s previous reports to Court, the Credit Facility Agent, on 
behalf of the Credit Agreement Lenders is the Applicant’s senior secured creditor, 
subject to the Court-ordered Charges (as defined in the ARIO) in this CCAA 
Proceeding. 

5. Goodmans has provided an Ontario law opinion to the Monitor that, subject to 
customary assumptions and qualifications, the security relating to the Credit 
Agreement creates a validly perfected security interest in favour of the Credit Facility 
Agent in the Credit Agreement Collateral. 

9
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3.0 Proposed Distribution 

3.1 Cash Available 

1. The Applicant is seeking authorization to make one or more distributions to the Credit 
Facility Agent for the benefit of the Credit Agreement Lenders of the Cash and 
Proceeds subject to retaining amounts sufficient to pay: (i) any amounts secured by 
the Charges and such other amounts as determined by the Applicant, after 
consultation with the Requisite Consenting Lenders (as defined in the Transaction 
Support Agreement), and with the consent of the Monitor, or as otherwise ordered by 
the Court (collectively, the “Priority Amounts”) and (ii) such other amounts as the 
Applicant, with the consent of the Requisite Consenting Lenders or further Order of 
this Court, determines necessary, including to facilitate the ongoing administration of 
this CCAA Proceeding and the activities of the Applicant (the “Administrative 
Reserve” and together with the Priority Amounts, the “Holdbacks”). Any such 
distribution would be free and clear of all Claims and Encumbrances.  

2. The proposed Stay Extension and Distribution Order provides that the Applicant 
shall  make all distributions to the Credit Facility Agent for application by the Credit 
Facility Agent (i) in accordance with the provisions of the Credit Agreement (including 
the payment of all fees, expenses, charges, and all other amounts payable to the 
Credit Facility Agent in its capacity as such) and applicable law; and (ii) following 
authorization and direction from the Required Lenders (as defined in the Credit 
Agreement), in order to enable the Credit Facility Agent to provide the necessary 
funding to fund the LVI Chapter 11 Litigation Trust as is contemplated by, and in 
accordance with, the LVI Chapter 11 Plan.  As such, the Credit Facility Agent may, as 
contemplated under the LVI Chapter 11 Plan, fund the LVI Chapter 11 Litigation Trust 
with a portion of any distributions made pursuant to the proposed Stay Extension and 
Distribution Order. 

3.2 Charges 

1. As described above, the amounts secured by the DIP Lender’s Charge in favour of 
BMO and the Financial Advisor Charge in favour of PJT were both paid out in full and 
the DIP Lender’s Charge and Financial Advisor Charge were discharged, as provided 
in the AVO.  Furthermore, the Bid Protections Charge (as defined in the ARIO) in 
favour of BMO as the stalking-horse bidder in the SISP was also released pursuant 
to the AVO.  Accordingly, the remaining Charges are: 

a) Administration Charge (as defined in the ARIO) in the maximum amount of 
$3,000,000; 

b) Directors’ Charge, to the maximum amount of $15,409,000, which the Applicant 
is seeking to reduce to $2,000,000; and 

c) ERP Charge in the maximum amount of $5,350,000, which the Applicant is 
seeking to have discharged as all amounts secured thereby have now been 
paid. 

2. Accordingly, if the Court approves the reduction in the Directors’ Charge and the 
discharge of the ERP Charge, the remaining Charges will total $5 million, which will 
form a portion of the Holdbacks.  

10
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3. As set out in the First Report, the Directors’ Charge was granted to protect directors 
and officers for any liabilities they may incur in their capacity as such following the 
commencement of these proceedings, including unpaid wages, source deductions, 
vacation pay and sales taxes.  As noted above, the Applicant is no longer conducting 
any business operations and does not have any employees.  In addition, each former 
employee of the Applicant has been paid all amounts owing in respect of wages and 
vacation pay according to the Applicant’s books and records, all source deductions 
have been remitted and all HST has been remitted for the period ending May 31, 
2023. Given that the known obligations secured under the Directors’ Charge have 
been paid in full, the Applicant is seeking to reduce the Directors’ Charge from 
$15.409 million to $2 million. The reduced Directors’ Charge is intended to protect 
directors and officers in respect of any unknown obligations that may arise in the 
future. Given that no director and officer claims process has been conducted, the 
Monitor is of the view that it is appropriate for the Court to grant an Order reducing the 
Directors’ Charge as requested.  In due course, the Monitor expects for the balance 
of the Directors’ Charge to be released, subject to Court approval. The Monitor 
understands that notice of the proposed reduction of the Directors’ Charge has been 
provided to all the Applicant’s former directors and officers that are beneficiaries of 
the Directors’ Charge. The Monitor also understands that the reduction in the 
Directors’ Charge is supported by the Consenting Stakeholders. 

4. The Monitor understands from the Applicant and A&M that the Employee Retention 
Plans have been fully paid out.  Accordingly, the Monitor is of the view that it is 
appropriate for the Court to grant an Order releasing the corresponding ERP Charge.  

3.3 CRA Matters 

1. The Applicant, in consultation with the Monitor, has held discussions with the Canada 
Revenue Agency (the “CRA”) to obtain a comfort letter (the “Comfort Letter”) in 
relation to distributions of the Cash and Proceeds to be made in accordance with the 
Stay Extension and Distribution Order, if granted. 

2. On June 27, 2023, the CRA delivered the Comfort Letter to the Applicant and the 
Monitor in escrow pending the hearing for the Stay Extension and Distribution Order.  

3.4 Recommended Distribution 

1. Based on the foregoing, and subject to the Comfort Letter being released from 
escrow, the Monitor is of the view that it is appropriate for the Applicant to be 
authorized to make distributions to the Credit Facility Agent of Cash and Proceeds, 
subject to the Holdbacks being sufficient to allow the Applicant, under the Monitor’s 
supervision, to realize on excluded assets from the Transaction, including to pursue 
certain litigation claims, as appropriate. At this time, the Monitor understands that no 
less than US$85 million of net proceeds from the Transaction will be available to 
distribute to the Credit Facility Agent on behalf of the Credit Agreement Lenders, 
which may be subject to additional upward adjustment and additional future 
distributions based on other recovery activities.  
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2. Subsequent distributions (if any) pursuant to the Stay Extension and Distribution 
Order, if granted, will be made based on the outcome of the purchase price 
adjustments in accordance with the Stalking Horse APA.  Distribution of proceeds of 
the realization of the Applicant’s remaining assets, including a potential tax refund 
claim of approximately $100 million which is pending before the Tax Court of Canada 
(the “CRA Litigation”), will be made subject to further court order.  

4.0 FF&E Transaction 

1. Under the Stalking Horse APA, BMO had the option of purchasing all of the Applicant’s 
furniture, fixtures and equipment (the “FF&E”).  However, the buyer ultimately only took a 
portion of the FF&E and a substantial amount of FF&E still remains at the Toronto Office.  

2. The Toronto Office lease was not an assumed contract under the Transaction, and 
accordingly, on June 9, 2023, the Applicant issued a Notice of Disclaimer in connection 
with the Toronto Office lease, which disclaimer will be effective on July 10, 2023.  The 
monthly occupancy costs under the Toronto Office lease are approximately $450,000 
after netting monthly sublease payments. 

3. In an effort to monetize the Remaining FF&E, the Applicant entered into a liquidator 
agreement (the “Liquidator Agreement”) with Infinity Asset Solutions Inc. (“Infinity”) to 
liquidate the Remaining FF&E.  The Liquidator Agreement provided for the conduct of an 
online auction and the removal of the assets from the Toronto Office within 45 days, which 
was a critical consideration given the significant occupancy costs.  Despite having a 45-
day occupancy period, the Monitor and Infinity had concerns whether all of the Remaining 
FF&E could be sold and removed during the period.  Under the Liquidator Agreement, the 
Applicant would have received the proceeds from the sale of each item, after Infinity’s 
commission.2    

4. Shortly after the disclaimer was sent and after learning about the Liquidator Agreement, 
First Gulf approached the Applicant to inquire about purchasing the Remaining FF&E.  On 
June 16, 2023, the Applicant, under the direction of the Monitor, entered into a Bill of Sale 
dated June 16, 2023 (the “Bill of Sale”) with First Gulf to sell the Remaining FF&E for the 
aggregate amount of $360,000, plus HST (collectively, the “FF&E Payment”).  A copy of 
the Bill of Sale is attached as Appendix “A”.  

5. To compensate Infinity for its due diligence and efforts incurred in connection with the 
Liquidator Agreement, the Applicant, under the direction of the Monitor, negotiated an 
exit-fee with Infinity whereby Infinity will receive $100,000 from the proceeds of the sale 
of the Remaining FF&E to First Gulf.  Under the terms of the Liquidator Agreement, Infinity 
would have received over $150,000, including approximately $45,000 for costs.  The exit-
fee is intended to compensate Infinity for costs incurred and lost commissions in the 
circumstances. Given the Liquidator Agreement, the Applicant could not have sold the 
Remaining FF&E to First Gulf without coming to an agreement with Infinity.  Based on the 
Monitor’s calculation, the proceeds from the Remaining FF&E Transaction are similar to 
the proceeds expected to have resulted from an auction pursuant to the Liquidator 

 
2 Under the Liquidator Agreement, Infinity was entitled to 10% of all proceeds from the sale of Remaining FF&E and 
also to an 18% buyers’ premium on all Remaining FF&E sales. 
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Agreement; however, there was additional risk in proceeding with an auction under the 
Liquidator Agreement as compared to a sale with First Gulf. In particular, the amount paid 
by First Gulf is guaranteed and Infinity was unsure whether all Remaining FF&E could be 
removed by the effectiveness of the lease disclaimer on July 10, 2023.  

6. The Monitor recommends that the Court issue an order approving the Remaining FF&E 
Transaction for the following reasons: 

a) the Remaining FF&E Transaction provides for the greatest guaranteed recovery 
available in the circumstances, which the Monitor views as a better alternative 
to incurring incremental occupancy costs during a liquidation period; 

b) the Monitor does not believe that further time spent marketing the Remaining 
FF&E will result in a superior transaction; and  

c) the Monitor believes that further time marketing the Remaining FF&E may result 
in professional costs exceeding any incremental sale proceeds. 

5.0 Cash Flow Forecast  

1. The Applicant’s most recent cash flow forecast filed with Court, a copy of which was 
appended to the Third Report, covered the period until July 28, 2023, and accordingly, 
provided for all of the post-Closing payments that the Applicant has made to date. As 
the Applicant is no longer conducting active business operations, a further cash flow 
projection has not been prepared for the stay extension period.  The remaining costs 
in these proceedings (largely professional fees) are to be funded from the funds in the 
Applicant’s bank accounts, which will include the Holdbacks (once determined), which 
are subject to the Administration Charge and the Directors’ Charge.   

2. Accordingly, the Monitor is of the view that the Applicant will have sufficient liquidity 
until June 28, 2024.     

6.0 Stay Extension 

1. The stay of proceedings currently expires on July 14, 2023.  The Applicant is 
requesting an extension of the stay of proceedings until June 28, 2024.  The Monitor 
supports the request for an extension of the stay of proceedings for the following 
reasons: 

a) given the limited number of matters remaining in this CCAA Proceeding (being, 
administrative matters related to distributions, the resolution of the post-closing 
purchase price adjustments from the Transaction and the CRA Litigation, which, 
if unresolved, will not proceed to trial until the fall of 2024), the Monitor does not 
believe it is appropriate to consume limited judicial resources dealing with 
additional stay extension motions when certain of the key remaining matters 
(primarily the CRA Litigation) are unlikely to be resolved in a short time frame;  
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b) the Applicant has been acting, and continues to act, in good faith and with due 
diligence and the Monitor’s powers have been enhanced to exercise any power 
which may be property exercised by a board of directors or any officers of the 
Applicant;  

c) no creditor will be prejudiced by the extension being sought;  

d) as of the date of this Report, neither the Applicant nor the Monitor is aware of 
any party opposed to an extension;  

e) the proposed Stay Extension and Distribution Order provides that the Monitor 
shall report to the Court and the Applicant’s stakeholders no less frequently than 
every six months;  

f) the Credit Agreement Lenders, being the principal economic stakeholders in 
these proceedings, have consented to the duration of the proposed stay 
extension; and   

g) it will provide the Applicant, under the direction of the Monitor, further time to:  

i. make one or more distributions to the Credit Facility Agent; 

ii. resolve the purchase price adjustments in connection with the Transaction 
and finalize other post-closing matters such as allocation of the purchase 
price; 

iii. advance the CRA Litigation, including any potential settlement 
discussions which may arise; 

iv. continue to review and consider potential paths to realize on any ancillary 
assets; and 

v. deal with any other outstanding administrative matters. 

7.0 Professional Fees  

1. The fees (excluding disbursements and HST) of the Monitor from the commencement 
of this CCAA Proceeding to May 31, 2023 total $807,966.50.  The fees (excluding 
disbursements and HST) of Goodmans from the commencement of this CCAA 
Proceeding to June 6, 2023 total $702,414.50. 

2. The average hourly rates for the Monitor and Goodmans for the referenced billing 
periods were $587.51 and $858.28, respectively. 

3. Detailed invoices in respect of the fees and disbursements of the Monitor and 
Goodmans3 are provided in appendices to the affidavits (the “Fee Affidavits”) filed by 
KSV and Goodmans attached as Appendices “B” and “C”, respectively.   

 
3 Portions of Goodmans’ invoices have been redacted to address matters of confidentiality or privilege.  
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4. The Monitor is of the view that the hourly rates charged by Goodmans are consistent 
with the rates charged by large corporate law firms practicing in the area of corporate 
insolvency and restructuring in the Toronto market, that Goodmans’ billings reflect 
work performed consistent with the Monitor’s instructions, and that the overall fees 
charged by Goodmans and the Monitor are reasonable and appropriate in the 
circumstances. 

8.0 Approval of Activities and Reports 

1. The Monitor is seeking approval of the Reports and its activities in these proceedings. 
The Monitor has not received any adverse comments with respect to any of its 
Reports, including all activities described therein.   

9.0 Conclusion and Recommendation 

1. Based on the foregoing, the Monitor respectfully recommends that this Honourable 
Court make the Orders granting the relief detailed in Section 1.1(1)(f) of this Report. 

 
*     *     * 

All of which is respectfully submitted, 

 
KSV RESTRUCTURING INC.,  
IN ITS CAPACITY AS MONITOR OF  
LOYALTYONE, CO.  
AND NOT IN ITS PERSONAL CAPACITY 
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COURT FILE NO.: CV-23-00696017-00CL 
 

 
ONTARIO 

SUPERIOR COURT OF JUSTICE 
(COMMERCIAL LIST) 

 
IN THE MATTER OF THE COMPANIES’ CREDITORS ARRANGEMENT ACT,  

R.S.C. 1985, C. C-36, AS AMENDED 
 

AND IN THE MATTER OF A PLAN OF COMPROMISE OR ARRANGEMENT  
OF LOYALTYONE, CO. 

 
 

AFFIDAVIT OF NOAH GOLDSTEIN  
(Sworn June 27, 2023) 

I, Noah Goldstein, of the City of Toronto, in the Province of Ontario, MAKE OATH AND 

SAY:  

1. I am a Managing Director of KSV Restructuring Inc. (“KSV”). 

2. Pursuant to an order (the “Initial Order”) issued by the Ontario Superior Court of Justice 

(Commercial List) (the “Court”) on March 10, 2023, LoyaltyOne, Co. (the “Applicant”) was granted 

protection under the Companies’ Creditors Arrangement Act, R.S.C. 1985, c. C-36, as amended 

(the “CCAA”), and KSV Restructuring Inc. (“KSV”) was appointed monitor of the Applicant (in such 

capacity, the “Monitor”). 

3. I have been involved in the management of this mandate since its outset.  As such, I have 

knowledge of the matters to which I hereinafter depose. 

4. On June 27, 2023, the Monitor finalized its Fourth Report to Court in which it outlined its 

activities with respect to the Applicant’s CCAA proceeding as well as provided information with 

respect to the Monitor’s fees and disbursements and those of its legal counsel, Goodmans LLP.  

5. I hereby confirm that attached as Exhibit “A” hereto are true copies of the accounts of KSV 

for the periods indicated and confirm that these accounts accurately reflect the services provided 

by KSV in this matter and the fees and disbursements claimed by it.    
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6. Additionally, attached hereto as Exhibit “B” is a summary of additional information with

respect to all members of KSV who have worked on this matter, including their roles, hours and 

rates, and I hereby confirm that the list represents an accurate account of such information. 

7. I consider the accounts to be fair and reasonable considering the circumstances

connected with this administration. 

8. I also confirm that the Monitor has not received, nor expects to receive, nor has the Monitor

been promised any remuneration or consideration other than the amount claimed in the accounts. 

SWORN BEFORE ME over videoconference 
by Noah Goldstein stated as being located in 
the City of Toronto in the Province of Ontario, 
before me at the City of Toronto in the 
Province of Ontario, on June 27, 2023, in 
accordance with O. Reg 431/20 Administering 
Oath or Declaration Remotely 

__________________________________ 
Catherine Anne Stuyck-Theriault, a Commissioner, etc., 
Province of Ontario, for KSV Advisory Inc. and  
KSV Restructuring Inc. 
Expires February 19, 2025 

____ 
 Noah Goldstein 
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This is Exhibit “A” referred to in the 

Affidavit of Noah Goldstein sworn before 

me, this 27th day of June, 2023 

…………………………………………………………………………. 

Catherine Anne Stuyck-Theriault, a Commissioner, etc., 

Province of Ontario, for KSV Advisory Inc. and KSV Restructuring Inc. 

Expires February 19, 2025 
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NoahGoldstein

ksvadvisoryinc.

220 Ba y Stre e t

Su ite 1300, PO Bo x 20

To ro n to , On ta rio , M5J2W 4

T + 1 416 9 32 6207

F+ 1 416 9 32 6266

n g o ld s te in @ k s v a d v is o ry .c o m

k s v a d v is o ry .c o m

March 22, 2023

DELIVERED BY EMAIL

LoyaltyOne , Co.
351 King StE, Suite 200
Toronto, ON M5A 0L6

Attention:ShawnStewart

De arSh awn:

Re: LoyaltyOne, Co.(the“Applicant”)

Enclose d ple ase find ourinvoice forse rvice sre nde re d forth e pe riod e nde d March 19 , 2023 inre spe ct
ofth e Applicant’sproce e dingsunde rth e Companies’CreditorsArrangementAct.

Foryourconve nie nce , we h ave include d ourwire instructionsonth e invoice .

Yoursve rytruly,

KSV RESTRUCTURING INC.
IN ITS CAPACITY AS CCAA MONITOR
OFLOYALTYONE, CO.
AND NOTIN ITS PERSONALCAPACITY

Pe r: Noah Goldste in
NG:rk
Encl(s)
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ksvadvisoryinc.

220 Ba y Stre e t

Su ite 1300, PO Bo x 20

To ro n to , On ta rio , M5J2W 4

T + 1 416 9 32 6262

F+ 1 416 9 32 6266

k s v a d v is o ry .c o m

INVOICE

Re: LoyaltyOne, Co.(the“Applicant”)

Forprofe ssionalse rvice sre nde re d forth e pe riod e nde d March 19 , 2023 byKSVRe structuring Inc. (“KSV”)
inconne ctionwith th e Applicant’sproce e dingsunde rth e Companies’CreditorsArrangementAct(“CCAA”),
including:

General

 Corre sponding e xte nsive lywith GoodmansLLP (“Goodmans”), th e Monitor’sle galcounse l,
and Casse ls Brock & Blackwe llLLP (“Casse ls”), counse lto th e Applicant, conce rning all
matte rsin th e CCAA proce e dings, including re gularcallsand e mailsasmore spe cifically
outline d be low;

 Corre sponding e xte nsive lyduring th e pe riod with re pre se ntative softh e Applicantand with
Alvare z & MarsalInc. (“A& M”), re structuring advisorto th e Applicant, re garding strate gic
issue sre lating toth e CCAA filing, including atte nding callsona dailybasis;

 Corre sponding with Torys LLP (“Torys”), counse lto th e Bank ofMontre al(“BMO”), in its
capacitie s as th e Applicant’s inte rim le nde rand stalking h orse bidde r, and with Be nne tt
Jone sLLP (“Be nne ttJone s”), counse ltoce rtainofth e Applicant’sse niorse cure d cre ditors,
conce rning variousmatte rsinth e CCAA proce e dings;

CCAA FilingandComebackMotion

 Re vie wing and comme nting on multiple ve rsions of alldraft court mate rials file d in
conne ctionwith th e Applicant’sCCAA applicationonMarch 10, 2023 (th e “CCAA Application
Mate rials”), including;

o th e InitialOrde r;

o th e AffidavitofSh awnSte wartswornMarch 10, 2023;and

o th e Factum ofth e Applicantdate d March 10, 2023;

LoyaltyOne , Co.
351 King StE, Suite 200
Toronto, ON M5A 0L6

March 22, 2023

Invoice No: 3048
H ST #: 818808768 RT0001
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 Corre sponding e xte nsive ly with Goodmans and Casse ls re garding th e draft CCAA
ApplicationMate rials, including atte nding callsonMarch 7, 8, 9 and 10, 2023;

 Drafting KSV’sPre -Filing Re porttoCourtdate d March 10, 2023 initscapacityaspropose d
CCAA monitor(th e “Monitor”) ofth e Applicant(th e “Pre -filing Re port”);

 Pre paring th e appe ndice stoth e Pre -filing Re port;

 Corre sponding e xte nsive lywith Goodmansand Casse lsre garding th e ircomme ntson th e
Pre -filing Re port;

 Re vie wing calculationspre pare d byA& M onth e variousCourtorde re d ch arge saspropose d
inth e InitialOrde rand discussing same with Casse lsand Goodmans;

 Atte nding Court(virtually) onMarch 10, 2023 re garding th e InitialApplication;

 Re vie wing multiple ite rationsofa DIPTe rm Sh e e tdate d March 10, 2023 be twe e nBMO and
th e Applicant(th e “DIP Te rm Sh e e t”) and corre sponding with Goodmans and Casse ls
re garding same ;

 Re vie wing and comme nting onmultiple ve rsionsofa DIPcash flow wh ich wasappe nde d to
th e DIP Te rm Sh e e tand corre sponding with A& M inre spe ctofth e cash flow proje ctionand
itsunde rlying assumptions;

 Re vie wing and comme nting onmultiple ite rationsofa Stalking H orse Purch ase Agre e me nt
date d March 10, 2023 be twe e nBMO and th e Applicantand corre sponding with Goodmans
and Casse lsre garding same ;

 Re vie wing and comme nting onmultiple ite rationsofa TransactionSupportAgre e me ntdate d
March 10, 2023 be twe e nth e Applicantand ce rtainofitsaffiliate sand th e Applicant’sse nior
se cure d le nde rs, and corre sponding with Goodmansand Casse lsre garding same ;

 Re vie wing th e Applicant’spropose d e mploye e re te ntionplansand corre sponding with A& M,
Casse lsand Goodmansre garding same ;

 Re vie wing and comme nting on allCourtmate rialsfile d in conne ction with th e Applicant’s
come backh e aring onMarch 20, 2023 (th e “Come backH e aring”), including:

o th e AffidavitofSh awnSte wartswornMarch 13, 2023;

o th e Ame nde d and Re state d InitialOrde r;

o th e Sale and Inve stme ntSolicitationProce ss(th e “SISP”) docume nts;

o th e SISP ApprovalOrde r;

o th e Factum ofBMO date d March 17, 2023;and

o th e Factum ofth e Applicantdate d March 17, 2023;

 Drafting th e Monitor’s FirstRe portto Courtdate d March 16, 2023 (th e “FirstRe port”) in
conne ctionwith th e Come backH e aring;

 Pre paring th e appe ndice stoth e FirstRe port;
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 Corre sponding e xte nsive ly with Goodmans and Casse ls re garding th e ir re spe ctive
comme ntsonth e FirstRe port;

 Pre paring and filing Form 1, InformationPe rtaining toth e InitialOrde r, with th e Office ofth e
Supe rinte nde ntofBankruptcyCanada (“OSB”) asre quire d unde rth e CCAA;

 Pre paring and filing Form 2, De btorCompany Information Summary, with th e OSB as
re quire d unde rth e CCAA;and

 Maintaining th e Se rvice Listinth e se proce e dingsonth e Monitor’scase we bsite and posting
allCourtmate rialsonth e Monitor’scase we bsite ;

OperationalMatters

 Re vie wing th e Applicant’s communication plan and oth e rnotice s (th e “Communications
Plan”) forth e Applicant’sstake h olde rsinconne ctionwith th e CCAA Proce e dings, including:

o colle ctorscripts;

o sponsorscripts;

o e mploye e le tte rs;

 Discussing th e CommunicationsPlanwith Goodmans, Casse lsand th e Applicant;

 Pre paring and causing a notice to be poste d in th e nationale dition ofThe NationalPost
ne wspape rinaccordance with th e InitialOrde r;

 Pre paring a statutorynotice date d March 15, 2023 to allknown cre ditorsofth e Applicant
advising ofth e CCAA proce e dings(th e “Notice toCre ditors”);

 Re vie wing and corre sponding with A& M re garding th e cre ditorlisting inconne ctionwith th e
Notice toCre ditors;

 Corre sponding with Casse lsand Goodmansre garding th e Notice toCre ditors;

 Corre sponding on a daily basis with A& M and manage me ntof th e Applicantto discuss
ope rational, supplie rsand colle ctorissue s;

 Atte nding callswith re pre se ntative softh e Applicant, BMO and ove r20 ofth e Applicant’s
ke ypartne rsre garding th e comme nce me ntofth e CCAA proce e dings;

 Atte nding multiple callswith Casse lsre garding ad-h oc issue swith ce rtain ke yve ndorsof
th e Applicant;

 Re sponding tocallsand e mailsfrom colle ctors, ve ndors, sponsorsand forme re mploye e s
re ce ive d th rough th e KSVde signate d LoyaltyOne h otline and e mailmailbox;and

 Monitoring, atth e Applicant’sre que st, th e LoyaltyOne Privacye mailmailboxtoide ntifyany
CCAA re late d que rie s;
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CashFlow & DIP Financing

 Re vie wing a proje cte d 16-we e kState me ntofCash Flow (th e “Proje ction”) pre pare d byA& M
forth e Applicantand corre sponding e xte nsive lywith A& M inconne ctionwith same ;

 Corre sponding with A& M re garding th e Applicant’sre porting re quire me nts unde rth e DIP
Te rm Sh e e t, including re vie wing a cash flow variance re portforth e we e ke nding March 10,
2023;

 Re vie wing a sch e dule ofproje cte d cure costspre pare d byA& M;

 Monitoring th e Applicant’sdailyre ce iptsand disburse me nts;

 Atte nding daily calls with A& M to re vie w propose d payme nts, as re quire d unde rth e DIP
Te rm Sh e e tand th e InitialOrde r;

 Re vie wing various ad-h oc re que sts from th e Applicantand A& M re garding propose d
payme ntsfrom th e Applicant’sre se rve accounts;

Other

 Corre sponding with th e Applicantand PJT Partne rs LP (“PJT”), th e Applicant’s financial
advisor, tore vie w th e propose d SISP, including atte nding twice we e klycallswith PJT;

 Re vie wing and comme nting onPJT’sdraftmarke ting mate rialspre pare d inconne ctionwith
th e SISP, including a te ase rand a confide ntialinformationme morandum;

 Conve ning inte rnalme e tings;and

 De aling with alloth e rmatte rsnototh e rwise re fe rre d toh e re in.

***

Totalfe e spe rattach e d time summary $ 220,79 3.75
H ST 28,703.19
TotalDue $ 249 ,49 6.9 4

W ireInstructions

Payto: KSVRe structuring Inc.
220 BayStre e t, Suite 1300
Toronto, ON M5J2W 4

Bank: BMO BankofMontre al
FirstCanadianPlace , 42nd Floor
Toronto, ON M5X 1A3

BankNo.: 001
Transit(ABA): 32132
AccountNo.: 3213-19 9 5-729
SwiftCode : BOFMCAM2
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P e r s o n n e l R a te ($) H o u r s Am o u n t ($)

No a h Go ld s te in 700 118.80 83,160.00

Da v id Sie ra d z k i 700 9 2.00 64,400.00

Mu rta z a Ta lle t 525 83.00 43,575.00

Me g Os tlin g 425 54.9 5 23,353.75

Oth e r s ta ff a n d a d m in is tra tio n 17.00 6,305.00

To ta l Fe e s 365.75 220,79 3.75

KSVRe s tru c tu rin g In c .

Lo y a lty O n e , Co .

T im e S u m m a r y

Fo r th e p e rio d e n d e d Ma rc h 19 , 2023
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Noah Goldstein

ksv advisory inc.

220 Bay Street

Suite 1300, PO Box 20

Toronto, Ontario, M5J 2W4

T +1 416 932 6207

F +1 416 932 6266

ngoldstein@ksvadvisory.com

ksvadvisory.com

April 12, 2023

DELIVERED BY EMAIL

LoyaltyOne, Co.
351 King St E, Suite 200
Toronto, ON M5A 0L6

Attention: Shawn Stewart

Dear Shawn:

Re: LoyaltyOne, Co. (the “Applicant”)

Enclosed please find our invoice for services rendered for the period ended March 31, 2023 in respect
of the Applicant’s proceedings under the Companies’ Creditors Arrangement Act.

For your convenience, we have included our wire instructions on the invoice.

Yours very truly,

KSV RESTRUCTURING INC.
IN ITS CAPACITY AS CCAA MONITOR
OF LOYALTYONE, CO.
AND NOT IN ITS PERSONAL CAPACITY

Per: Noah Goldstein
NG:rk
Encl(s)
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ksv advisory inc.

220 Bay Street

Suite 1300, PO Box 20

Toronto, Ontario, M5J 2W4

T +1 416 932 6262

F +1 416 932 6266

ksvadvisory.com

INVOICE

Re: LoyaltyOne, Co. (the “Applicant”)

For professional services rendered for the period ended March 31, 2023 by KSV Restructuring Inc. (“KSV”)
as Court-appointed Monitor (the “Monitor”) in connection with the Applicant’s proceedings under the
Companies’ Creditors Arrangement Act (“CCAA”), including:

General

 Corresponding extensively with Goodmans LLP (“Goodmans”), the Monitor’s legal counsel,
and Cassels Brock & Blackwell LLP (“Cassels”), counsel to the Applicant, concerning all
matters in the CCAA proceedings, including regular calls and emails as more specifically
outlined herein;

 Corresponding extensively during the period with representatives of the Applicant and with
Alvarez & Marsal Inc. (“A&M”), restructuring advisor to the Applicant, regarding strategic
issues relating to the CCAA filing, including attending cash management and other calls on
a daily basis;

 Corresponding with Torys LLP (“Torys”), counsel to the Bank of Montreal (“BMO”), in its
capacities as the Applicant’s interim lender and stalking horse bidder, and with Bennett
Jones LLP (“Bennett Jones”), counsel to certain of the Applicant’s senior secured creditors,
concerning various matters in the CCAA proceedings;

Court Matters

 Attending the Comeback Hearing (virtually) on March 20, 2023;

 Reviewing the Endorsement of Justice Conway dated March 20, 2023;

LoyaltyOne, Co.
351 King St E, Suite 200
Toronto, ON M5A 0L6

April 12, 2023

Invoice No: 3076
HST #: 818808768 RT0001
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Operational Matters

 Corresponding on a daily basis with A&M and management of the Applicant to discuss
operational, vendor and collector issues;

 Attending multiple calls with Cassels regarding ad-hoc issues with certain key vendors of
the Applicant;

 Responding to calls and emails from collectors, vendors, sponsors and former employees
received through the KSV designated LoyaltyOne hotline and email mailbox;

 Monitoring, at the Applicant’s request, the LoyaltyOne Privacy email mailbox to identify any
CCAA related queries;

Cash Flow & DIP Financing

 Corresponding with A&M regarding the Applicant’s reporting requirements under the DIP
Term Sheet;

 Monitoring the Applicant’s daily receipts and disbursements;

 Attending daily calls with A&M to review proposed payments, as required under the DIP
Term Sheet and the Initial Order;

 Reviewing various ad-hoc requests from the Applicant and A&M regarding proposed
payments from the Applicant’s reserve accounts;

 Corresponding with A&M regarding a change in the methodology for calculating withholding
taxes in connection with intercompany transfers to the Applicant’s US parent;

 Reviewing a schedule of payments to be made under certain Court-approved retention plans
and corresponding with A&M regarding same;

SISP

 Corresponding with the Applicant and PJT Partners LP (“PJT”), the Applicant’s financial
advisor, in connection with the Applicant’s Court-approved sale process (the “SISP”),
including attending twice weekly calls with PJT and Cassels;

 Reviewing SISP materials including the Confidential Information Memorandum and Teaser;

 Reviewing regular updates from Cassels regarding the SISP, including a summary of
correspondence with interested parties;

 Reviewing and commenting on the closing agenda prepared in connection with the SISP;

BMO Calls

 Reviewing a preliminary closing cure costs estimate prepared by A&M;

 Attending a call on March 24, 2023 with BMO and the Applicant regarding human resource
and technology integration;

 Attending a call on March 24, 2023 with BMO and the Applicant regarding real estate
integration;
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 Attending a call on March 24, 2023 with BMO and the Applicant regarding accounting
system integration;

 Attending a call on March 24, 2023 with BMO and the Applicant regarding the continuation
of the transition services agreement;

 Attending calls on March 25, 26, 27 and 28, 2023 with Cassels regarding issues with the
Canada Revenue Agency (the “CRA”) and the Intercompany DIP;

 Attending a call on March 27, 2023 with BMO and the Applicant regarding key talent
personnel;

 Attending a call on March 28, 2023 with BMO and the Applicant regarding the integration of
benefits;

 Attending calls on March 28 and 31, 2023 with Goodmans;

 Attending a call on March 30, 2023 with BMO and the Applicant regarding IT integration;

 Attending a call on March 31, 2023 with BMO and the Applicant regarding software
contracts;

 Attending a call on March 31, 2023 with BMO and the Applicant regarding marketing
integration;

 Attending a call on March 31, 2023 with Piper Sandler, advisor to certain of the term lenders;

 Reviewing and summarizing relevant materials related to the CRA tax dispute;

 Reviewing and summarizing the Chapter 11 Plan in the US Chapter 11 proceedings of
Loyalty Ventures Inc., and certain of its affiliates;

 Reviewing withholding tax calculations and rationale;

 Convening internal meetings; and

 Dealing with all other matters not otherwise referred to herein.

* * *

Total fees per attached time summary $ 110,889.50
HST 14,415.64
Total Due $ 125,305.14
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Wire Instructions

Pay to: KSV Restructuring Inc.
220 Bay Street, Suite 1300
Toronto, ON M5J 2W4

Bank: BMO Bank of Montreal
First Canadian Place, 42nd Floor
Toronto, ON M5X 1A3

Bank No.: 001
Transit (ABA): 32132
Account No.: 3213-1995-729
Swift Code: BOFMCAM2
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Personnel Rate ($) Hours Amount ($)

Noah Goldstein 700 31.10 21,770.00

David Sieradzki 700 42.00 29,400.00

Robert Harlang 650 11.00 7,150.00

Eli Brenner 535 6.25 3,343.75

Murtaza Tallat 525 39.50 20,737.50

Meg Ostling 425 64.34 27,344.50

Other staff and administration 5.75 1,143.75

Total Fees 199.94 110,889.50

KSV Restructuring Inc.

LoyaltyOne, Co.

Time Summary

For the period ended March 31, 2023
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Noah Goldstein

ksv advisory inc.

220 Bay Street

Suite 1300, PO Box 20

Toronto, Ontario, M5J 2W4

T +1 416 932 6207

F +1 416 932 6266

ngoldstein@ksvadvisory.com

ksvadvisory.com

May 9, 2023

DELIVERED BY EMAIL

Loy alty One , Co.
351 King St E, Suite 200
Toronto, ON M5A 0L6

Attention: Shawn Stewart

De arSh awn:

Re: LoyaltyOne, Co. (the “Applicant”)

Enclose d p le ase find ourinvoice forse rvice sre nde re d for th e p e riod e nde d Ap ril30, 2023 in re sp e ct
of th e Ap p licant’sp roce e dingsunde rth e Companies’ Creditors Arrangement Act.

Fory ourconve nie nce , we h ave include d ourwire instructionson th e invoice .

Y oursve ry truly ,

KSV RESTRUCTURING INC.
IN ITS CAPACITY AS CCAA MONITOR
OF LOYALTYONE, CO.
AND NOT IN ITS PERSONAL CAPACITY

Pe r: Noah Goldste in

NG:rk
Encl(s)
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ksv advisory inc.

220 Bay Street

Suite 1300, PO Box 20

Toronto, Ontario, M5J 2W4

T +1 416 932 6262

F +1 416 932 6266

ksvadvisory.com

INVOICE

Re: LoyaltyOne, Co. (the “Applicant”)

Forp rofe ssionalse rvice sre nde re d forth e p e riod e nde d Ap ril30, 2023 b y KSV Re structuring Inc. (“KSV”)
asCourt-ap p ointe d Monitor (th e “Monitor”) in conne ction with th e Ap p licant’sp roce e dingsunde r th e
Companies’ Creditors Arrangement Act (“CCAA”), including:

General

 Corre sp onding e x te nsive ly with Goodm ansLLP (“Goodm ans”), th e Monitor’sle galcounse l,
and Casse lsBrock & Blackwe llLLP (“Casse ls”), counse lto th e Ap p licant, conce rning all
m atte rsin th e CCAA p roce e dings, including ne ardaily callsand e m ailson th e issue sm ore
sp e cifically outline d h e re in;

 Corre sp onding e x te nsive ly during th e p e riod with re p re se ntative sof th e Ap p licant and with
Alvare z & MarsalInc. (“A&M”), re structuring advisor to th e Ap p licant, re garding strate gic
issue sre lating to th e CCAA filing, including atte nding cash m anage m e nt and oth e rcallson
a daily b asis;

 Corre sp onding with Tory sLLP (“Tory s”), counse lto th e Bank of Montre al(“BMO”), in its
cap acitie sasth e Ap p licant’sinte rim le nde r and stalking h orse b idde r, and with Be nne tt
Jone sLLP (“Be nne tt Jone s”), counse lto ce rtain of th e Ap p licant’sse niorse cure d cre ditors,
conce rning variousm atte rsin th e CCAA p roce e dings;

Court Matters

 Drafting th e Monitor’sTh ird Re p ort to Court date d Ap ril27, 2023 (th e “Th ird Re p ort”) file d in
conne ction with th e Ap p licant’sm otion to p e rform ce rtain ob ligationsunde r th e Plan of
Re organization file d b y th e Ap p licant’sUS p are nt (th e “US Plan”);

 Re vie wing th e US Plan and US court m ate rialsfile d in conne ction with a h e aring in th e US
on Ap ril27, 2023 and discussing sam e with Goodm ansand Casse ls;

 Re vie wing th e Ap p licant’sliquidation analy sisfile d in th e US p roce e dingsforth e p urp ose s
of th e Monitor’sre com m e ndationsse t out in th e Th ird Re p ort;

Loy alty One , Co.
351 King St E, Suite 200
Toronto, ON M5A 0L6

May 5, 2023

Invoice No: 3101
HST #: 818808768 RT0001
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 Atte nding (virtually ) at th e US court h e aring on Ap ril27, 2023;

 Discussing th e draft Th ird Re p ort with Goodm ansand Casse lsb e fore finalizing sam e ;

 Re vie wing and com m e nting on allCourt m ate rialsfile d in conne ction with th e Ap p licant’s
m otion fora Plan Pe rform ance Orde rre turnab le May 1, 2023;

 Drafting th e Monitor’sFourth Re p ort to Court, to b e file d, in conne ction with th e Ap p licant’s
sale ap p rovalm otion re turnab le May 12, 2023;

 Re vie wing and com m e nting on m ultip le draft ve rsionsof orde rsfor th e May 12th h e aring,
including th e Sale Ap p roval and Ve sting Orde r, th e Ancillary Re lie f Orde r and th e
Assignm e nt Orde rand discussing sam e with Goodm ansand Casse ls;

 Re vie wing and com m e nting on a draft Distrib ution Orde rfora m otion to b e b rough t in June ,
2023;

 Re vie wing and sum m arizing th e Ap p licant’stax p le ading docum e nts;

Operational Matters

 Corre sp onding on a daily b asiswith A&M and m anage m e nt of th e Ap p licant to discuss
op e rational, ve ndorand colle ctorissue s;

 Atte nding m ultip le callswith Casse lsre garding ad-h oc issue swith ce rtain ke y ve ndorsof
th e Ap p licant;

 Re sp onding to callsand e m ailsfrom colle ctors, ve ndors, sp onsorsand form e r e m p loy e e s
re ce ive d th rough th e KSV de signate d Loy alty One h otline and e m ailm ailb ox ;

 Monitoring, at th e Ap p licant’sre que st, th e Loy alty One Privacy e m ailm ailb ox to ide ntify any
CCAA re late d que rie s;

 W orking daily at th e Ap p licant’sh e adquarte rssince Ap ril19, 2023 to organize , file and store
re le vant docum e ntsin accordance with th e Ap p licant’sre cord re te ntion p olicy ;

 Organizing contractorsto com p le te im aging of th e Ap p licant’sdata sy ste m s;

 Re vie wing corre sp onde nce from Casse lsre garding conse ntsto contract assignm e ntsfrom
h undre dsof contract counte rp artie sand discussing sam e inte rnally ;

 Re vie wing and com m e nting on a sch e dule of p ost-closing workstre am sand discussing
sam e with Casse ls;

Cash Flow & DIP Financing

 Corre sp onding with A&M re garding th e Ap p licant’sre p orting re quire m e ntsunde r th e DIP
Te rm Sh e e t;

 Monitoring th e Ap p licant’sdaily re ce ip tsand disb urse m e nts;

 Atte nding daily callswith A&M to re vie w p rop ose d p ay m e nts, asre quire d unde r th e DIP
Te rm Sh e e t and th e InitialOrde r;
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 Re vie wing variousad-h oc re que stsfrom th e Ap p licant and A&M re garding p rop ose d
p ay m e ntsfrom th e Ap p licant’sre se rve accounts;

 Re vie wing a sch e dule of p ay m e ntsto b e m ade unde rce rtain Court-ap p rove d re te ntion p lans
and corre sp onding with A&M re garding sam e ;

SISP

 Corre sp onding with th e Ap p licant and PJT Partne rsLP (“PJT”), th e Ap p licant’sfinancial
advisor, in conne ction with th e Ap p licant’sCourt-ap p rove d sale p roce ss(th e “SISP”),
including atte nding twice we e kly callswith PJT and Casse ls;

 Re vie wing SISP m ate rialsincluding th e Confide ntialInform ation Me m orandum and Te ase r;

 Re vie wing re gularup date sfrom PJT re garding th e SISP, including a tracke rsum m arizing
corre sp onde nce with inte re ste d p artie s;

 Re vie wing an am e ndm e nt to th e Stalking Horse APA and discussing itsim p licationswith
Goodm ansand Casse ls;

 Re vie wing corre sp onde nce b e twe e n Stike m an Elliott LLP, le galcounse lto Bre ad Financial
Holdings, Inc. (“Bre ad”), and Casse lsin conne ction with a disp ute re garding a p ote ntial
assignm e nt of a transition se rvice sagre e m e nt;

 Corre sp onding with Goodm ansre garding th e p ote ntialdisp ute b e twe e n th e Ap p licant and
Bre ad;

BMO Calls

 Atte nding callson Ap ril3, 4, 5, 6, 11, 12, 13, 14, 17, 21, 24, 25, and 26, 2023 with BMO and
th e Ap p licant re garding te ch nology sy ste m sinte gration and variousissue s;

 Atte nding a callon Ap ril3, 2023 with BMO and th e Ap p licant re garding HR and contract
inte gration;

 Atte nding a callon Ap ril4, 2023 with BMO and th e Ap p licant re garding HR p roce sse s;

 Atte nding a callon Ap ril4, 2023 with BMO and th e Ap p licant re garding le galdiscussions
and contract re vie ws;

 Atte nding a callon Ap ril12, 2023 with BMO and th e Ap p licant re garding HR inte gration and
offe rle tte rp roce sse s;

 Atte nding a callon Ap ril12, 2023 with BMO and th e Ap p licant re garding p rivacy , com p liance
and risk clarifications;

 Atte nding a callon Ap ril17, 2023 with Casse lsre garding re cord re te ntion p lansfor th e
Ap p licant;

 Atte nding we e kly Ste e ring Com m itte e callswith se nior re p re se ntative sof BMO and th e
Ap p licant;

 Conve ning inte rnalm e e tings; and
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 De aling with alloth e rm atte rsnot oth e rwise re fe rre d to h e re in.

* * *

Totalfe e sand disb urse m e ntsp e rattach e d tim e sum m ary $ 239,410.10
HST 31,123.31
TotalDue $ 270,533.41

Wire Instructions

Pay to: KSV Re structuring Inc.
220 Bay Stre e t, Suite 1300
Toronto, ON M5J 2W 4

Bank: BMO Bank of Montre al
First Canadian Place , 42nd Floor
Toronto, ON M5X 1A3

Bank No.: 001
Transit (ABA): 32132
Account No.: 3213-1995-729
Swift Code : BOFMCAM2
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Personnel Rate ($) Hours Amount ($)

Noah Goldstein 700 73.50 51,450.00

David Sieradzki 700 96.75 67,725.00

Robert Harlang 650 32.50 21,125.00

Murtaza Tallat 525 96.20 50,505.00

Meg Ostling 425 105.74 44,939.50

Other staff and administration 7.65 3,341.25

Total Fees 412.34 239,085.75

Add: Out of Pocket Disbursements

WiFi usage 18.00

Postage 235.30

Photocopies 71.05

Disbursements 324.35

Total Fees and Disbursements 239,410.10

KSV Restructuring Inc.

LoyaltyOne, Co.

Time Summary

For the period ended April 30, 2023
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Noah Goldstein

ksv advisory inc.

220 Bay Street

Suite 1300, PO Box 20

Toronto, Ontario, M5J 2W4

T +1 416 932 6207

F +1 416 932 6266

ngoldstein@ksvadvisory.com

ksvadvisory.com

May 29, 2023

DELIVERED BY EMAIL

LoyaltyOne, Co.
351 King St E, Suite 200
Toronto, ON M5A 0L6

Attention: Shawn Stewart

Dear Shawn:

Re: LoyaltyOne, Co. (the “Applicant”)

Enclosed please find our invoice for services rendered for the period May 1 to May 26, 2023 plus an
estimate for fees from May 27 to closing of a transaction with Bank of Montreal in the Applicant’s
proceedings under the Companies’ Creditors Arrangement Act.

For your convenience, we have included our wire instructions on the invoice.

Yours very truly,

KSV RESTRUCTURING INC.
IN ITS CAPACITY AS CCAA MONITOR
OF LOYALTYONE, CO.
AND NOT IN ITS PERSONAL CAPACITY

Per: Noah Goldstein
NG:rk
Encl(s)
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ksv advisory inc.

220 Bay Street

Suite 1300, PO Box 20

Toronto, Ontario, M5J 2W4

T +1 416 932 6262

F +1 416 932 6266

ksvadvisory.com

INVOICE

Re: LoyaltyOne, Co. (the “Applicant”)

For professional services rendered for the period ended May 31, 2023 by KSV Restructuring Inc. (“KSV”)
as Court-appointed Monitor (the “Monitor”) in connection with the Applicant’s proceedings under the
Companies’ Creditors Arrangement Act (“CCAA”), including:

General

 Corresponding extensively with Goodmans LLP (“Goodmans”), the Monitor’s legal counsel,
and Cassels Brock & Blackwell LLP (“Cassels”), counsel to the Applicant, concerning all
matters in the CCAA proceedings, including near daily calls and emails on the issues more
specifically outlined herein;

 Corresponding extensively during the period with representatives of the Applicant and with
Alvarez & Marsal Inc. (“A&M”), restructuring advisor to the Applicant, regarding strategic
issues relating to the CCAA filing, including attending cash management and other calls on
a daily basis;

 Corresponding with Torys LLP (“Torys”), counsel to the Bank of Montreal (“BMO”), in its
capacities as the Applicant’s interim lender and stalking horse bidder, and with Bennett
Jones LLP (“Bennett Jones”), counsel to certain of the Applicant’s senior secured creditors,
concerning various matters in the CCAA proceedings;

Court Matters

 Attending at Court (virtually) on May 1, 2023 for the Applicant’s motion for a US Plan
Performance Order;

 Reviewing the endorsement of Justice Conway dated May 1, 2023;

 Drafting the Monitor’s Third Report to Court dated May 8, 2023 in connection with the
Applicant’s sale approval motion returnable May 12, 2023;

LoyaltyOne, Co.
351 King St E, Suite 200
Toronto, ON M5A 0L6

May 29, 2023

Invoice No: 3125
HST #: 818808768 RT0001
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 Reviewing and commenting on multiple draft versions of orders for the May 12th hearing,
including the Sale Approval and Vesting Order, the Ancillary Relief Order and the
Assignment Order and discussing same extensively with Goodmans and Cassels;

 Attending at Court (virtually) on May 12, 2023 for the Applicant’s sale approval motion;

 Reviewing the endorsement of Justice Conway dated May 12, 2023;

 Reviewing and commenting on a draft Distribution Order for a motion to be brought in June,
2023;

Operational Matters

 Corresponding on a daily basis with A&M and management of the Applicant to discuss
operational, vendor and collector issues;

 Attending multiple calls with Cassels regarding ad-hoc issues with certain key vendors of
the Applicant;

 Responding to calls and emails from collectors, vendors, sponsors and former employees
received through the KSV designated LoyaltyOne hotline and email mailbox;

 Monitoring, at the Applicant’s request, the LoyaltyOne Privacy email mailbox to identify any
CCAA related queries;

 Attending at the Applicant’s headquarters on a near daily basis to deal with, inter alia, the
Applicant’s books and records and the post-closing liquidation of the Applicant’s office
furniture;

 Reviewing Notices of Disclaimer regarding hundreds of contracts that will be disclaimed in
conjunction with the closing of a Court-approved transaction with Bank of Montreal (“BMO”);

 Reviewing and commenting on a schedule of post-closing workstreams and discussing
same with Cassels;

 Reviewing multiple versions of a draft waterfall for the Applicant’s secured lenders and
discussing same with Cassels and A&M;

 Corresponding with Infinity Asset Solutions throughout the month in connection with a post-
closing liquidation of the Applicant’s office furniture;

Cash Flow & DIP Financing

 Corresponding with A&M regarding the Applicant’s reporting requirements under the DIP
Term Sheet;

 Monitoring the Applicant’s daily receipts and disbursements;

 Attending daily calls with A&M to review proposed payments, as required under the DIP
Term Sheet and the Initial Order;

 Reviewing various ad-hoc requests from the Applicant and A&M regarding proposed
payments from the Applicant’s reserve accounts;
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 Reviewing a schedule of payments to be made under certain Court-approved retention plans
and corresponding with A&M regarding same;

SISP and BMO Transaction

 Corresponding with the Applicant and PJT Partners LP (“PJT”), the Applicant’s financial
advisor, in connection with the Applicant’s Court-approved sale process (the “SISP”),
including attending twice weekly calls with PJT and Cassels;

 Reviewing an amendment to the Stalking Horse APA and discussing its implications with
Goodmans and Cassels;

 Reviewing correspondence between Stikeman Elliott LLP, legal counsel to Bread Financial
Holdings, Inc. (“Bread”), and Cassels in connection with a dispute regarding a potential
assignment of a transition services agreement;

 Corresponding with Goodmans regarding the potential dispute between the Applicant and
Bread;

 Reviewing multiple versions of closing documents circulated by Torys and Cassels;

 Reviewing and commenting on multiple versions of an Escrow Agreement;

 Arranging for an escrow account to be opened for US$10 million of the sale proceeds to be
deposited on closing;

 Reviewing schedules of cure cost payments, draft purchase price adjustments and other
transaction analyses;

BMO Calls

 Attending calls on May 2, 4, 6, 8, 10, 11, 14, 19, 21, 24, 25, and 26, 2023 with BMO and the
Applicant regarding technology systems integration and various other issues;

 Attending weekly Steering Committee calls with senior representatives of BMO and the
Applicant;

 Convening internal meetings; and

 Dealing with all other matters not otherwise referred to herein.

* * *

Total fees and disbursements per attached time summary $ 237,403.49
HST 30,862.45
Total Due $ 268,265.94
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Wire Instructions

Pay to: KSV Restructuring Inc.
220 Bay Street, Suite 1300
Toronto, ON M5J 2W4

Bank: BMO Bank of Montreal
First Canadian Place, 42nd Floor
Toronto, ON M5X 1A3

Bank No.: 001
Transit (ABA): 32132
Account No.: 3213-1995-729
Swift Code: BOFMCAM2
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Personnel Rate ($) May 1 to 26 May 27 to 31 Amount ($)

Noah Goldstein 700 71.80 40.00 78,260.00

David Sieradzki 700 77.00 20.00 67,900.00

Murtaza Tallat 525 32.00 20.00 27,300.00

Meg Ostling 425 86.00 20.00 45,050.00

Other staff and administration 175-650 30.40 0.00 18,687.50

Total Fees 297.20 100.00 237,197.50

Total Disbursements (Ascend fee & Wifi) 205.99

Total Fees and Disbursements 237,403.49

KSV Restructuring Inc.

LoyaltyOne, Co.

Time Summary

For the period ended April 30, 2023

Hours
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This is Exhibit “B” referred to in the 

Affidavit of Noah Goldstein sworn before 

me, this 27th day of June, 2023 

…………………………………………………………………………. 

Catherine Anne Stuyck-Theriault, a Commissioner, etc., 

Province of Ontario, for KSV Advisory Inc. and KSV Restructuring Inc. 

Expires February 19, 2025 
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Exhibit "B"
LoyaltyOne, Co.
Schedule of Professionals' Time and Rates 
For the Period of March 7, 2023 to May 31, 2023

Role  Hours 
 Billing Rate 
(Per Hour) 

 Total Fees by 
Professional

($) 

Noah Goldstein Overall Responsibility 335.20        700$              234,640.00      
David Sieradzki Overall Responsibility 327.75        700$              229,425.00      
Robert Harlang Mandate Assistance 43.50          650$              28,275.00        
Eli Brenner Sale Process Assistance 6.25            535$              3,343.75          
Murtaza Tallat All aspects of mandate 270.70        525$              142,117.50      
Meg Ostling All aspects of mandate 331.03        425$              140,687.75      
Other staff and administrative 60.80          $   175 - 525 29,477.50        

1,375.23     807,966.50      

Total hours 1,375.23          
Total fees 807,966.50$    

Average hourly rate 587.51             

Name
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Appendix “C”
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Court File No. CV-23-00696017-00CL

ONTARIO
SUPERIOR COURT OF JUSTICE

COMMERCIAL LIST

IN THE MATTER OF THE COMPANIES' CREDITORS
ARRANGEMENT ACT, R.S.C. 1985, c. C-36, AS AMENDED

AND IN THE MATTER OF A PLAN OF COMPROMISE OR
ARRANGEMENT OF LOYALTYONE, CO.

(the "Applicant")

AFFIDAVIT OF CHRISTOPHER ARMSTRONG
(Sworn June 27, 2023)

I, Christopher Armstrong, of the City of Toronto, in the Province of Ontario, MAKE

OATH AND SAY:

1. I am a partner with the law firm of Goodmans LLP ("Goodmans"), which is counsel to

KSV Restructuring Inc. ("KSV") in its capacity as court-appointed monitor (the "Monitor") of

the Applicant in the within proceedings under the Companies' Creditors Arrangement Act (the

"CCAA"). As such, I have knowledge of the matters hereinafter deposed to, except where stated

to be on information and belief and whereso stated I verily believe it to be true.

2. KSV was appointed as Monitor pursuant to the Initial Order (as amended and restated, the

"Initial Order") of the Ontario Superior Court of Justice (Commercial List) (the "Court") on

March 10, 2023. The Monitor retained Goodmans as its counsel in these proceedings.

3. Pursuant to paragraph 27 of the Initial Order, the Monitor and its legal counsel are to be

paid their reasonable fees and disbursements, in each case at their standard rates and charges,

whether incurred prior to, on or subsequent to the date of the Initial Order, by the Applicants as

part of the proceedings. Pursuant to paragraph 28 of the Initial Order, the Monitor and its legal

counsel are required to pass their accounts from time to time, and for this purpose the accounts of

the Monitor and its legal counsel are referred to the Court.

4. Attached hereto as Exhibit "A" are true copies of the accounts (the "Goodmans

Accounts") rendered by Goodmans to the Monitor during the course of the Applicant's CCAA
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proceedings, being the period between March 10, 2023 and June 6, 2023, inclusive (the

"Application Period"). The Goodmans Accounts have been redacted to address matters of

confidentiality or privilege.

5. Attached hereto as Exhibit "B" is a schedule summarizing the Goodmans Accounts in

respect of the Application Period. As shown in the summary, Goodmans incurred fees and

disbursements during the Application Period totalling $796,879.79, comprised of fees of

$702,414.50, costs of $2,788.85 and taxes of $91,676.44.

6. Attached hereto as Exhibit "C" is a schedule summarizing the respective years of call and

billing rates of each of the professionals at Goodmans that rendered services to the Monitor during

the Application Period, the hours worked by each such individual, and the average hourly rates for

the file. As shown in the summary, Goodmans incurred a total of 818.4 hours in connection with

this matter during the Application Period, at an average hourly rate of $858.28.

7. To the best of my knowledge, the rates charged by Goodmans during the Application

Period are comparable to the rates charged by similar law firms in the Toronto market for the

provision of similar services. I believe that the total hours, fees and disbursements incurred by

Goodmans during the Application Period are reasonable and appropriate in the circumstances.

8. This Affidavit is sworn in connection with a motion by the Monitor for the approval of the

fees and disbursements of the Monitor and its legal counsel and for no improper purpose.

SWORN BEFORE ME at the City of Toronto,

in the Province of Ontario on June 27, 2023.

A Commissioner for taking affidavits
Name: Erik Axell
LSO # 853450
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THIS IS EXHIBIT "A"
TO THE AFFIDAVIT OF CHRISTOPHER ARMSTRONG
SWORN BEFORE ME THIS 27th DAY OF JUNE, 2023

~wa0, 
Commissioner for Taking Affidavits
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Goodman"

March 28, 2023

Our File No.: 230517

KSV Advisory Inc.
1300 — 220 Bay Street
Toronto, ON M5J 2W4

Attention: Noah Goldstein 

Dear Noah:

Re: Project Loyalty

Please find enclosed our account for services rendered with respect to the
the period up to and including March 26, 2023.

I trust you will find the enclosed to be in order. If you have any questions
please do not hesitate to contact me.

Yours very truly,

GOODMANS LLP

Brendan O'Neill
BO/oa
Encl.

7362201

Barristers & Solicitors

Bay Adelaide Centre
333 Bay Street, Suite 3400
Toronto, Ontario M5H 2S7

Telephone: 416.979.2211
Facsimile: 416.979.1234
goodmans.ca

Direct Line: 416.849.6017
boneill@goodmans.ca

above noted matter for

regarding the enclosed,
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Goo mans

KSV Advisory Inc.
1300 - 220 Bay St
Toronto, ON M5J 2W4
Canada

Attention: Noah Goldstein

Re: Project Loyalty

Barristers & Solicitors

Bay Adelaide Centre
333 Bay Street, Suite 3400
Toronto, Ontario M5H 2S7

Telephone: 416.979.2211
Facsimile: 416.979.1234
goodmans.ca

GST Registration Number R119422962

March 28, 2023

Our File No. KSVA 230517

Invoice No. 793028

To our professional services rendered in connection with the above noted matter:

Date TKID Hours

03/03/23 KSN 0.70

03/05/23 GSE 0.40

03/05/23 KSN 0.30

03/07/23 ACH 9.40

03/07/23 BON 6.90

03/07/23 CAG 7.10

03/07/23 DDC 2.70

03/07/23 EAX 1.70

03/08/23 ABG 0.50

Description

Consider tax issues; review and respond to emails re: same.

Research; emails to K. Saddington re: deposits.

Review and respond to emails re: HST considerations.

Reviewing and revising pre-filing monitor's report; reviewing consent to act as
monitor and email to KSV re: same; drafting security review; review comments
and reviewing and revising same; reviewing and providing comments on draft
purchase agreement; reviewing updated orders and term sheets.

Attention to Pre-Filing Report; attention to Communications Plan material;
attend c/c with KSV re: first day hearing matters; attention to revised drafts of
Approval and Vesting Order; attention to revised DIP Term Sheet; attention to
Cash Flow Forecast matters; review PJT Engagement Letter; attention to
Intercompany DIP Term Sheet; attention to further revised DIP Term Sheet;
attention to update discussions/emails with Cassels and KSV.

Telephone call with KSV/internal team re: status of matters and various
outstanding issues; review and comment on BMO transaction agreement and
internal emails re: same and reviewing A. Harmes comments and circulating
mark-up to CBB; review and comment on updates turns of DIP and emails with
internal team and CBB re: comments on same; review and comment on RSA and
emails with internal team re: same.

Reviewing intercompany loan term sheet; reviewing and revising security
review opinion; reviewing revised DIP; correspondence re: remaining issues.

Consolidating comments and updating Monitor's pre filing report; drafting

Monitor's consent form.

Obtaining profile report and correspondence with K. Holdaway re: trust name
etc.
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Invoice No. 793028

Our File No. KSVA 230517

Date TKID Hours Description

03/08/23 ACH

03/08/23 BON

03/08/23 CAG

03/08/23 DDC

03/08/23 DVR

03/09/23 ACH

03/09/23 BON

03/09/23 CAG

03/09/23 DDC

03/09/23 EAX

03/09/23 PRK

Page 2

March 28, 2023

6.40 Reviewing and revising security review; reviewing and providing comments on
chart re: operation of business and reserve account; reviewing and revising pre-
filing report; reviewing service lists; reviewing revised materials and drafting
email re: same.

8.30 Attention to revised BMO Acquistion Term Sheet; attention to revised BMO
Term Sheet; attention to Intercompany DIP Term Sheet; attention to revised
Cash Flow Forecast; attention to Security Review; attention to draft Factum;
attention to draft Transaction Support Agreement; attend update call with
Cassels and KSV; attention to draft Pre-Filing Report.

8.60 Review/consider competition comments and emails with D. Rosner re: same and
circulating to CBB; discussion with A. Harmes and D. Dedic re: security review;
review/consider updated draft of APA and emails/telephone calls with client and
CBB re: same; review and comment on security opinion; emails to CBB re:
comments on TSA; brief review of Ch. 11 plan and disclosure statement;
review/revise updated draft of pre-filing report; telephone call with CBB and
KSV re: status update on various case matters; review updated Initial Order and
emails with KSV re: same.

2.00 Reviewing revised security review opinion; discussion re: same; considering
conflict of laws issues; reviewing revisions to DIP agreement; correspondence
re: same; correspondence re: orders and filing matters.

1.40 Reviewing materials from C. Armstrong, including draft transaction agreement;
drafting email to C. Armstrong re: competition provisions of draft transaction
agreement; reviewing further mark-up of agreement and emailing regarding the
same.

10.00 Reviewing updated affidavit and orders; reviewing and revising monitor's pre-
filing report and attending to various matters re: same; attending to various
matters in advance of CCAA filing; reviewing, revising and finalizing security
review; reviewing and revising collector notice.

10.50 Attention to revised: Transaction Support Agreement, BMO Acquisition Term
Sheet, BMO DIP Term Sheet, Pre-Filing Report, Initial Order, Initial Affidavit,
Factum for I0 hearing, Security Review, Specified Collector Notice; attention to
delivery of Pre-Filing Report to Justice Conway; attention to update discussions
with Cassels; attention to hearing prep. discussions with Cassels.

13.20 Review and comment on updated versions of SISP, 10, DIP, APA, pre-filing
report and other filing materials and numerous emails and telephone conferences
with KSV and CBB re: same; revise APA re: Monitor issues; consider issues re:
lender request/adequate assurance and reviewing issue; numerous telephone
conferences/emails with client and Cassels re: finalization of court materials and
outstanding issues and attend to final review/revisions of pre-filing report to be

delivered to Court; consider various legal issues re: Day 1 relief and

emails/telephone calls with internal team re: same.

2.50 Reviewing updated DIP and materials; discussion re: security review issues and

adequate protection; reviewing excluded collateral matters; reviewing updated

filing documents; correspondence.

3.30 Reviewing draft court materials in advance of first day hearing.

0.60 Review Monitor dispute resolution portion of agreement and provide proposed

edits.
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03/10/23 ABG 0.40 Updating summary; correspondence to C. Armstrong.

Page 3

March 28, 2023

03/10/23 ACH 3.50 Attending to matters re: finalizing pre-filing report; attending to service re:
same; attending to matters re: affidavit of service and filing of pre-filing report;
reviewing and revising service list.

03/10/23 BON 6.40 Review final Application Record; update and finalize Pre-Filing Report re:
same; prepare for CCAA Initial Order hearing; attend CCAA Initial Order
hearing; attention to review of blacklines re: all final deal documents; attention
to various follow-on Initial Order hearing matters.

03/10/23 CAG 7.10 Review updated versions of company filing materials and revising pre-filing
report and circulating to client for finalization and delivering; attend Ll initial
order hearing; review final revisions to DIP, ARIO, SISP, SISP Order, RSA and
BMO APA and emails with internal team re: comments on same; interoffice
conference with E. Ferreira re: review of BMO APA and case background;
emails with CBB re: notice service matters; coordinating with E. Axell re:
Chapter 11 hearing attendance.

03/10/23 DDC 2.20 Discussion with B. O'Neill and C. Armstrong; reviewing materials; reviewing
adequate protection matters.

03/10/23 EAX 3.80 Attending Chapter 11 first day hearing and summarizing the key happenings;
reviewing transaction materials and providing blacklines for review purposes.

03/10/23 EVF 0.50 Call with C. Armstrong re: Air Miles background.

03/10/23 NAF 3.20 Reviewing and revising drafts of the SISP, SISP Approval Order, Amended and
Restated Initial Order and Approval and Vesting Order.

03/11/23 BON 2.20 Review blacklines of final BMO deal documents (ATS and DIP) and exhibits
thereto (SISP, etc).

03/11/23 CAG 0.50 Telephone call with N. Goldstein re: preparation of comeback materials and
related matters; emails with CBB re: various comeback matters.

03/11/23 DDC 0.20 Correspondence.

03/12/23 ACH 1.00 Reviewing draft affidavit re: comeback.

03/12/23 BON 5.50 Attention to draft court material for Comeback Hearing and review of all related
amendments to all BMO deal and various SISP process documents; attention to
SISP matters and planning; attention to emails/discussions re: AMEX matters.

03/12/23 CAG 5.80 Review and comment on company comeback materials and revised versions of
Orders and SISP and numerous internal emails re: same and emails with CBB re:
comments; review and comment on final version of BMO transaction agreement
and disclosure schedules and emails with internal team re: additional comments
and relaying comments to CBB.

03/12/23 DDC 3.90 Reviewing filed materials; reviewing comeback materials; reviewing final DIP;
reviewing intercompany DIP; comments to same; correspondence re: reserve
fund mattes; revising APA re: same.

03/12/23 DVR 0.40 Reviewing materials forwarded by C. Armstrong.

03/12/23 EVF 7.80 Reviewing court materials, APA and disclosure letter; corresponding with C.
Armstrong re: same.
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03/13/23 ACH 7.00

03/13/23 BON 4.60

03/13/23 CAG 10.10

03/13/23 DDC 2.20

03/13/23 EAX 1.20

03/13/23 EVF 2.30

03/13/23 NAF 0.80

03/14/23 ACH 5.50

03/14/23 BON 5.90

03/14/23 CAG 7.60

03/14/23 DDC 1.90

03/14/23 EAX 2.00

03/14/23 KSN 2.40

03/15/23 ACH 3.00

03/15/23 BON 6.40

Page 4

March 28, 2023

Description

Reviewing and providing comments on draft first report; reviewing revised
comeback hearing materials; revising service list and attending to
correspondence re: same; reviewing and revising notice to creditors.

Attention to comments to definitive BMO documentation and related CCAA
materials (DIP Term Sheet, Intercompany DIP Term Sheet, etc); attention to
draft court material for Comeback Hearing (Notice of Application, Affidavit,
ARIO); attention to draft First Report of the Monitor.

Review updated turns of various comeback hearings documents; emails with
Cassels re: various notice and CCAA comeback matters; interoffice conference
with D. Dedic re: Intercompany DIP term sheet; review and comment on draft
First Report of Monitor and reviewing various agreements/orders re: same and
internal emails re: same; attend telephone call with Cassels and AMEX counsel.

Reviewing intercompany DIP; revising same; correspondence; correspondence
re: US filing materials; correspondence re: monitor's report; reviewing same.

Reviewing Monitor's First Report.

Reviewing and revising monitor's report.

Reviewing and revising first report of the monitor.

Reviewing and commenting on revised version of report; drafting rider to report
re: intercompany DIP; reviewing and revising same; reviewing and revising
report; drafting email to Cassels re: same.

Attention to Intercompany DIP Loan Term Sheet; attention to draft First Report
of the Monitor; attend update call with Cassels, PJT, A&M and KSV; attention
to emails/discussions re: Intercompany DIP matters; attention to BMO access
matters; attention to RBC Reserve Account matters.

Reviewing internal comments on First Report and circulating updated draft to
client with overview of outstanding issues; status update call with
Cassels/A&M/PJT/KSV re: SISP and various other matters; considering issues
re: intercompany DIP Note and telephone calls and emails with Bennett Jones,
client and K. Saddington re: same; emails/telephone conferences with Cassels
and KSV re: RBC matters; emails re: AMEX issues; emails with client about
BMO meetings with company; review and comment on updated draft of First
Report and emails with internal team and KSV re: same.

Reviewing and revising monitor's report; correspondence re: intercompany DIP;
reviewing riders re: same.

Reviewing Monitor's First Report; reviewing Asset Purchase Agreement.

Consider tax issues; calls with C. Armstrong re: same.

Reviewing factum; reviewing and revising report; revising and revising rider re:
intercompany DIP loan; attending to various email correspondence re: monitor's
report and related matters.

Attention to draft First Report of the Monitor; attention to matters re:
Intercompany DIP Loan; attention to draft Factum for Comeback Hearing;
attention to service matters; attention to update discussions with counsel to Term
Loan Lenders; attention to Intercompany DIP Order; attention to Intercompany
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Date TKID Hours Description

DIP Term Sheet.

03/15/23 CAG 9.20 Attending to multiple turns of First Report and multiple emails and telephone
conferences with KSV, Cassels and internal team re: same; review and comment
on US DIP Order and circulating comments; review and comment on Applicant
factum; review and comment on further revisions to Intercompany DIP Term
Sheet.

03/15/23 DDC 2.20 Correspondence re: riders to monitor's report; correspondence re: intercompany
DIP; reviewing US interim order and comments to same; meeting with R.
Kurtzer.

03/15/23 EAX 1.30 Reviewing draft US interim DIP order.

03/15/23 KSN 0.30 Review and respond to emails.

03/16/23 ACH 2.20 Reviewing revised report; attending to various matters re: finalizing report and
attending to service and filing of same.

03/16/23 BON 8.80 Attention to First Report of the Monitor; attention to draft Factum; attention to
SISP matters; attention to Intercompany DIP Term Sheet and Intercompany DIP
Order; attention to finalization of Lender support; attention to finalization of
First Report of the Monitor and service and filing of same.

03/16/23 CAG 6.70 Reviewing and revising First Report and numerous telephone conferences and
emails with client, Cassels, Torys and Bennett Jones re: comments on same and
status of lender signatures; review and comment on applicant factum; review and
comment on various DIP and SISP documents.

03/16/23 EVF 2.00 Reviewing and providing comments on SISP materials.

03/16/23 KSN 0.30 Call with C. Armstrong re: tax considerations.

03/17/23 ACH 0.50 Attending to matters re: court materials and filings.

03/17/23 BON 3.50 Attention to drafts of sales process documents: SISP Process Letter; form of
NDA; and form of Clean Team Agreement; attention to Factum for Comeback
Hearing; attend update call with Cassels, A&M and KSV; attention to BMO
Factum; attention to BMO DIP Amendment; attention to BMO DIP Draw
Request.

03/17/23 EVF 0.50 Revising SISP process letter, confidentiality agreement and clean team
agreement.

03/18/23 ACH 1.30 Reviewing email from Cassels re: proposed amendment to ARIO; reviewing
reserve agreement re: fees; email to B. O'Neill re: same.

03/18/23 BON 0.40 Attention to McCarthys comments to ARIO; emails/discussions re: same.

03/19/23 BON 5.50 Attention to preparation for CCAA 3/20 hearing re: ARIO and SISP Approval
Order; attention to McCarthys comments to ARIO.

03/19/23 CAG 0.20 Review/consider RBC proposed language for ARIO and emails with internal
team re: same.

03/20/23 BON 4.50 Attention to DIP Amendment #1; attention to DIP Draw Request #1; attention to
DIP variance report; prepare for and attend CCAA comeback hearing.

03/20/23 CAG 0.20 Emails with team re: Comeback Hearing matters.
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Date TKID Hours Description

03/20/23 EVF 1.00 Reviewing teaser and CIM.

03/21/23 ACH 1.00 Observing US court hearing re: interim DIP motion; email to B. O'Neill and C.
Armstrong re: same.

03/21/23 BON 3.90 Attend update call with Cassels, PJT, A&M and KSV; attention to draft CIM
and Teaser; attention to emails/discussions re: key partner matters; attention to
US Chapter 11 hearing re: final US DIP Order and revisions to same re: Bread
matters; attention to final Intercompany DIP loan term sheet.

03/21/23 CAG 0.40 Attend update call with client, company, PJT and A&M.

03/21/23 DDC 0.80 Reviewing US order, final intercompany DIP and advance request;
correspondence.

03/21/23 EAX 0.90 Attending Chapter 11 hearing on DIP order and status of case.

03/22/23 ACH 1.00 Call with Cassels, Torys and KSV re: key partner updates; drafting email to B.
O'Neill and C. Armstrong re: same.

03/22/23 BON 1.20 Attention to SISP matters and interested party materials; attention to
emails/discussions re: Key Partner matters; attention to scheduling matters with
CCAA court.

03/22/23 CAG 0.20 Review update email from A. Harmes re: Chapter 11 matter and stakeholder
matters.

03/23/23 BON 0.60 Attention to emails/discussions re: various SISP matters and status.

03/24/23 CAG 0.60 Attend update call with Cassels/KSV/PJT; brief review of closing agenda;
review emails re: APA escrow agreement.

Total Fees $257,728.50
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March 28, 2023

Billed
Amount

BON O'Neill, Brendan 85.10 1,185.00 100,843.50

CAG Armstrong, Chris 77.50 915.00 70,912.50

DDC Dedic, Dan 20.60 915.00 18,849.00

KSN Saddington, Kenneth 4.00 960.00 3,840.00

PRK Kolla, Peter 0.60 915.00 549.00

DVR Rosner, David 1.80 1,150.00 2,070.00

GSE Ernst, Glenn S. 0.40 1,265.00 506.00

EVF Ferreira, Evita 14.10 760.00 10,716.00

ACH Harmes, Andrew 51.80 750.00 38,850.00

EAX Axell, Erik 14.20 550.00 7,810.00

NAF Fazli, Nargis 4.00 600.00 2,400.00

ABG Bunting, Amanda 0.90 315.00 283.50

DPS Word Processing 0.90 110.00 99.00

Total Fees $257,728.50

Disbursements

Description Amount

Telephone - Long Distance 1.74

Copies 850.00

Search - EDD 162.15

Delivery - Courier 17.15

Total Disbursements $1,031.04

Total Fees On This Invoice $257,728.50

ON HST @ 13.0% $33,504.70

Taxable Disbursements $1,031.04

Total Disbursements On This Invoice $1,031.04

ON HST @ 13.0% $134.04

Total On This Invoice (CAD) $292,398.28
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THIS IS OUR ACCOUNT HEREIN

E. & O.E.
BON/

Page 8

March 28, 2023

This invoice may not reflect all time and disbursements incurred on this matter to date. It is payable upon receipt
and in accordance with Section 33 of the Solicitors Act (Ontario), interest will be charged at the rate of 1.50% per
annum on unpaid fees, charges or disbursements calculated one month from the date this invoice is delivered.

Remittance information:

CAD Electronic Wire Payment or EFT (not e-Transfer):
Beneficiary Bank: TD Canada Trust, 394 Bay Street, Toronto, ON M5H 2Y3
Beneficiary Account Name: Goodmans LLP
Beneficiary Address: 333 Bay Street, Suite 3400, Toronto, Ontario M5H 2S7
Bank ID (for wire payments): 004 Bank ID (for EFT payments): 0004
Transit: 12162 Swift code: TDOMCATTTOR
CAD account: 0552488

USD Electronic Wire Payment:
Beneficiary Bank: TD Canada Trust, 394 Bay Street, Toronto, ON M5H 2Y3
Beneficiary Account name: Goodmans LLP
Beneficiary Address: 333 Bay Street, Suite 3400, Toronto, Ontario M5H 2S7
Bank ID (for wire payments): 004 Transit: 12162
USD account: 7359751 Swift code: TDOMCATTTOR
Intermediary Bank: Bank of America, New York, NY, USA
ABA: 026009593 Swift code: BOFAUS3NXXX

Email payment details, including invoice #, matter # and amount paid, to: collections@goodmans.ca

Cheques or Bank draft payable to: Goodmans LLP
Send to: Goodmans LLP, 333 Bay Street, Suite 3400, Toronto, Ontario M5H 2S7
Please enclose remittance copy including invoice #, matter # and amount paid.

93



Good answ

April 28, 2023

Our File No.: 230517

KSV Advisory Inc.
1300 — 220 Bay Street
Toronto, ON M5J 2W4

Attention: Noah Goldstein 

Dear Noah:

Re: Project Loyalty

Please find enclosed our account for services rendered with respect to the
the period up to and including April 27, 2023.

I trust you will find the enclosed to be in order. If you have any questions
please do not hesitate to contact me.

Yours very truly,

GOODMANS LLP

Brendan O'Neill
BO/oa
Encl.

7372662

Barristers & Solicitors

Bay Adelaide Centre
333 Bay Street, Suite 3400
Toronto, Ontario M511 2S7

Telephone: 416.979.2211
Facsimile: 416.979.1234
goodmans.ca

Direct Line: 416.849.6017
boneill@goodmans.ca

above noted matter for

regarding the enclosed,
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Goodmans

KSV Advisory Inc.
1300 - 220 Bay St
Toronto, ON M5J 2W4
Canada

Attention: Noah Goldstein

Re: Project Loyalty

Barristers & Solicitors

Bay Adelaide Centre
333 Bay Street, Suite 3400
Toronto, Ontario M5H 2S7

Telephone: 416.979.2211
Facsimile: 416.979.1234
good ma ns.ca

GST Registration Number R119422962

April 28, 2023

Our File No. KSVA 230517

Invoice No. 794999

To our professional services rendered in connection with the above noted matter:

Date TKID Hours Description

03/27/23 BON 1.40 Attention to emails/discussions re: SISP matters; attention to emails/discussions
re: US Plan confirmation matters.

03/27/23 DDC 0.30 Reviewing BMO closing agenda.

03/27/23 EVF 3.20 Reviewing and revising closing agenda; corresponding internally re: same.

03/28/23 BON 3.60 Review Chapter 11 Plan and Disclosure Statement; attend c/c with Cassels and
Torys re: same; attention to draft Closing Agenda for BMO Transaction; attend
by-weekly status call with Cassels, KSV, A&M and PJT; attention to scheduling
matters with CCAA court; attention to SISP update materials; attention to DIP
draw request #2; attention to emails/discussions re: regulatory matters re: BMO
transaction.

03/28/23 CAG 0.60 Review/consider matters re: intercompany DIP advances and emails with
Cassels and internal team re: same.

03/28/23 CAG 0.50 Attend update call with KSV/PJT/Cassels/A&M.

03/28/23 DDC 0.90 Correspondence re: APA checklist and AVO; correspondence re: filings and
discharges; reviewing DIP funding request, cash flow and related issues;

correspondence re: same.

03/28/23 EAX 5.10 Reviewing Chapter 11 Plan; reviewing and analyzing the provisions of the

Chapter 11 Plan which affects Canadian debtor and DIP lender and drafting

chart to summarize same.

03/28/23 EVF 2.30 Reviewing and revising closing agenda; corresponding re: same.

03/29/23 ACH 0.50 Meeting re: next steps; instructing E. Axell re: review of transition services

arrangements.

03/29/23 BON 2.60 Attention to draft closing agenda for BMO transaction; attention to analysis of

US Chapter 11 Plan and Disclosure Statement; attention to emails/discussions

95



Invoice No. 794999

Our File No. KSVA 230517

Date TKID Hours

03/29/23 CAG 1.10

03/29/23 DDC 0.50

03/29/23 EAX 7.00

03/29/23 EVF 0.50

03/30/23 BON 0.90

03/30/23 CAG 0.40

03/30/23 EAX 7.20

03/31/23 BON 0.40

03/31/23 BON 1.70

03/31/23 CAG 1.70

03/31/23 EAX 6.40

03/31/23 EVF 0.30

04/03/23 BON 0.50

04/03/23 EAX 2.60

04/04/23 BON 2.70

04/04/23 EAX 0.40

04/05/23 BON 1.30

04/05/23 CAG 0.30

04/05/23 DDC 0.30

04/06/23 BON 2.80

Page 2

April 28, 2023

Description

re: intercompany DIP loan advance matters.

Interoffice conference with B. O'Neill and A. Harmes re: status of case
matters/US Plan matters; interoffice conference with E. Axe11 re: review of US
Plan/disclosure statement re: Ll implications; emails re: BMO closing agenda.

Correspondence re: DIP advances; correspondence re: APA matters.

Reviewing Chapter 11 Plan; analyzing same and drafting chart re: summary of
provisions of Chapter 11 Plan re: effects on Canadian debtor and DIP lender;
attending at Data Room re: reviewing Transition Services Agreement.

Corresponding re: closing agenda; revising same.

Attention to emails/discussions with KSV re: key open items and next steps;
attention to DIP Variance Report.

Emails with KSV and B. O'Neill re: US Plan/Bread issues; review DIP variance.

Reviewing Chapter 11 Plan; analyzing same and drafting chart re: summary of
provisions of Chapter 11 Plan re: effects on Canadian debtor and DIP lender.

Review and comment on Consent for Third Party Contracts; internal
emails/discussions re: same.

Attention to update emails/discussions with KSV re: key open items and next
steps; attend bi-weekly c/c with Cassels, A&M and KSV; attention to BMO
closing agenda.

Update call with KSV re: various case matters; attend status update call with
client/Cassels/A&M/PJT; review and comment on contract assignment letter;
brief review of memo from E. Axell re: US Plan matters.

Reviewing Chapter 11 Plan; analyzing same and drafting chart re: summary of
provisions of Chapter 11 Plan re: effects on Canadian debtor and DIP lender.

Reviewing and revising consent letter.

Attention to emails/discussions re: SISP update.

Reviewing data room, Westlaw, and Canlii for

Attend bi-weekly update call with KSV, Cassels, A&M and PJT; attention to
SISP updates;
attention to diligence re: TSA matters and emails/discussions with Cassels re:
same.

Updating service list.

Attention to emails/discussions re: intercompany DIP loan advance to LVI;
attention to emails/discussions re: Competition Act matters; attention to SISP
updates.

Reviewing emails form Company counsel re: DIP and competition matters.

Reviewing DIP advance matters; correspondence re: same.

Review and discuss SISP update materials; attention to Closing Folders re: BMO
closing docs;
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Date TKID Hours Description

04/06/23 CAG 0.30 Emails and brief telephone call with K. Saddington re: LI tax returns.

04/06/23 KSN 1.50 Review pleadings; call with C. Armstrong.

04/06/23 MHR 0.60 Review and analyze Tax Court pleadings.

04/07/23 BON 2.70 Attention to analysis of US Chapter 11 Plan on Ll and memorandum to KSV re:
same.

04/07/23 MHR 1.10 Review and summarize Tax Court pleadings.

04/08/23 MHR 1.00 Review and summarize Tax Court pleadings.

04/09/23 KSN 0.60 Review pleadings.

04/10/23 CAG 2.70 Review and comment on summary memo re: US Plan impacts on Ll and emails
with internal team re: same and reviewing US Plan re: same; review updated
draft of contact assignment letter.

04/10/23 EAX 2.50 Reviewing Chapter 11 Plan; analyzing same and drafting chart re: summary of
provisions of Chapter 11 Plan re: effects on Canadian debtor and DIP lender.

04/10/23 EVF 0.80 Reviewing revised form of consent; corresponding internally re: same.

04/11/23 BON 5.60 Attention to SISP update; attention to cash flow variance reporting; attention to
various BMO closing documents and matters; attention to draft Consent for
Third Party Contracts; attention to draft APA Section 2.6 Notice re: additional
Assumed & Excluded Contracts and emails/discussions re: same; attend update
call with Cassels, A&M and KSV; attention to analysis of US Chapter 11 Plan
effects on Ll and memorandum to KSV re: same.

04/11/23 CAG 3.10 Review/revise Chapter 11 Plan memo and reviewing Chapter 11 Plan and
disclosure statement and circulating to KSV; attend status update call with
KSV/Cassels/PJT/A&M; emails with Cassels re: Confirmation Order matters.

04/1 1/23 DDC 0.40 Correspondence re: US Order; correspondence re: DIP advance request;
reviewing same.

04/11/23 KSN 1.00 Review pleadings; consider tax issues.

04/11/23 MITR 1.30 Draft memo summarizing Tax Court pleadings.

04/12/23 CAG 0.40 Emails with KSV re: US Plan/TSA matters and emails with E. Axell re:
reviewing same.

04/12/23 EAX 2.00 Reviewing Chapter 11 Plan and Transaction Support Agreement; drafting
correspondence to client re: effects of the Transaction Support on the Chapter 11
Plan.

04/12/23 MHR 1.40 Prepare draft memo summarizing tax court proceedings.

04/13/23 CAG 0.80 Emails with E. Axell and KSV re: US Plan/TSA matters; review emails re:
Reserve Account matters.

04/13/23 EAX 2.60 Reviewing Chapter 11 Plan and Transaction Support Agreement; drafting
correspondence to client re: effects of the Transaction Support on the Chapter 11
Plan.

04/13/23 MHR 0.10 Correspondence re tax court pleadings.
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Date TKID Hours Description

04/14/23 ACH 0.50 Reviewing Chapter 11 docket re: amendment to Chapter 11 Plan; drafting email
re: same.

04/14/23 CAG 0.60 Emails with KSV re: US Plan matters; attend update call with KSV and Cassels.

04/17/23 ACH 1.00

04/17/23 BON 0.30 Attention to emails/discussions re: records retention matters.

04/17/23 CAG 1.20
and reviewing APA re: same; emails with Cassels/client re:

book and records.

04/17/23 EAX 1.60 Reviewing Chapter 11 Plan Supplement re: effects on Canadian Debtor and Dip
Lender.

04/17/23 KSN 1.80 Consider tax issues; review pleadings memo; call with C. Armstrong.

04/17/23 MHR 1.40 Call with C. Armstrong and K. Saddington re Tax Court pleadings; review and
revise summary memo.

04/18/23 'ACH 0.50 Reviewing Chapter 11 docket; considering and discussing next steps.

04/18/23 BON 2.30 Attention to emails/discussions re: status of SISP process and proposed next
steps;

04/18/23 CAG 0.90 and emails with client re: same; review
emails with client/PJT/Cassels re: status of SISP; considering issues re: release
of Ll intercompany claims.

04/18/23 KSN 2.00 Revise pleadings memo; consider tax issues; review Purchase Agreement.

04/18/23 MHR 0.30 Revise memo summarizing Tax Court pleadings and send to C. Armstrong.

04/19/23 ACH 4.80 Reviewing draft Affidavit and Order re: US Plan confirmation; reviewing US
Plan and memo re: same.

04/19/23 BON 2.60 Attention to draft US Plan Performance Order; attention to draft Affidavit re:
same; review US Plan Supplement and Liquidation Analysis re: same.

04/19/23 CAG 0.90 Emails with KSV re: US Plan matters; review and comment on draft motion
materials re: US Plan matters.

04/19/23 EAX 1.90 Reviewing Chapter 11 Plan Supplement re: effects on Canadian Debtor and Dip
Lender.

04/20/23 ACH 6.60 Reviewing comments on draft Affidavit; reviewing draft Affidavit and drafting
email to Cassels re: same; reviewing Chapter 11 Plan and disclosure statement;
reviewing letter from Stikemans re: assignment of Transition Services
Agreement; considering issues re: same; reviewing key documents re: same.

04/20/23 BON 4.70 Attention to draft letter to BMO re: successful bid; review and discuss
Stikemans letter re: Bread Financial matters; attention to follow-on legal
analysis and document review re: same; review Cash Flow Variance Report;
attention to draft US Plan Performance Order; attention to draft Affidavit re:
same; attention to emails/discussions re: advance ruling certificate for BMO
transaction.

04/20/23 CAG 3.10 Telephone call with client re: distribution tax issues and considering same and
reviewing materials and email to K. Saddington re: same; review and comment
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04/20/23 EAX 2.30

04/20/23 KSN 2.40

04/21/23 ACH 5.50

04/21/23 BON 2.40

04/21/23 CAG 2.30

04/21/23 CBES 0.80

04/21/23 EAX 3.50

04/21/23 KSN 1.80

04/21/23 MJS 0.30

04/22/23 EAX 6.00

04/23/23 CAG 0.10

04/23/23 EAX 9.10

04/23/23 KSN 0.40

04/23/23 MHR 1.00

04/24/23 ACH 7.80

04/24/23 BON 6.90

04/24/23 CAG 3.70

Invoice No. 794999

Our File No. KSVA 230517

Date TKID Hours Description

on successful bid notice and emails with client re: same; review and comment on
marked-up internal version of US Plan Affidavit; review/consider
correspondence from Bread re: TSAJTMA and instructions to team re: review of
underlying agreements.

Reviewing and revising Affidavit for approval of Chapter 11 Plan; researching
and locating documents related to potential litigation; updating set-vice list.

Consider tax and structure issues; review Purchase Agreement; call with C.
Armstrong.

Reviewing key documents re: partial assignment of Transition Services
Agreement; drafting overview re: considerations for same.

Attend update c/c with KSV, Cassels and A&M; attention to matters re: US
Chapter 11 Plan confirmation hearing; attention to legal analysis re: Bread
arguments on TSA assignment; attention to tax matters re: contemplated Plan
distributions.

Prepare for/attend update call with client, Cassels and PJT re: SISP and various
other case matters; considering distribution issues and multiple entails with
client and tax team re: same; telephone call with K. Saddington re:
tax/distribution issues and reviewing credit agreement re: same.

Discussion with K. Saddington re: insolvencytax issues;

Page 5

April 28, 2023

Reviewing letter from Stikemans re: claim that Ll contract cannot be assigned to
BMO; reviewing Ll agreements to determine validity of claims.

Consider tax issues; call with C. Armstrong; review and respond to entails.

Discuss issues re: distributions with K. Saddington.

Review correspondence to Bread counsel.

Email re: research instructions; consider tax issues.

Reviewing Chapter 11 combined disclosure statement and Plan; reviewing and
providing comments on draft Report; drafting email to KSV re: Second Report.

Review and comment on draft US Plan Confirmation Order; review and
comment on draft Second Re ort of the Monitor;

memo re: same.

RevieW and comment on US Confirmation Order; review and comment on draft
2nd Report and interoffice conference with A. Harmes re: same and reviewing
US Plan materials and prior filings.
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Invoice No. 794999

Our File No. KSVA 230517

Date TKID Hours Description

04/24/23 DDC 0.50 Reviewing Confirmation Order.

04/24/23 EAX 4.40

Page 6

April 28, 2023

reviewing Monitor's Fourth Report.

04/24/23 KSN 1.00 Consider tax issues; review and respond to emails.

04/24/23 MHR 2.40
scussions wit r K. Sa mgton re same.

04/24/23 MJS 0.30 Discuss issues re: distribution with K. Saddington.

04/24/23 NKA 1.20 Drafting list of relevant dates from Stalking Horse APA and list of relevant
deliverables.

04/25/23 ACH 4.80 reviewing and
providing comments on Ancillary Relief Order.

04/25/23 BON 3.40 Attention to draft Second Report of the Monitor; attention to draft US Plan
Confirmation Order; review Application Report filed for May 1 CCAA hearing
re: CDN Order re: US Plan implementation; attention to documentation for third
intercompany DIP loan draw request; review and comment on draft Ancillary
Relief Order; review and comment on draft Stay Extensions and Distribution
Order.

04/25/23 CAG 2.10

reviewing emails from Cassels/KSV re: DIP advances.

04/25/23 EAX 1.80

04/25/23 KSN 1.50 Consider tax issues; review and respond to emails.

04/25/23 MHR 0.30

04/26/23 ACH 4.90 Reviewing and providing comments on Ancillary Relief Order and Distribution
and Stay Extension Order; further revisions re: same; drafting email to KSV re:
same; teleconference with KSV re: tax and distribution matters.

04/26/23 BON 3.80 Review and comment on draft Ancillary Relief Order; review and comment on

draft Stay Extension and Distribution Order; attend c/c with KSV re: distribution
matters and attention to research matters re: same; attention to draft Second
Report of the Monitor and Company comments re: same;

04/26/23 CAG 4.30

04/26/23 EAX 4.30

Tele hone call vith K Saddin ton re: distribution tax issues•

Review and comment on multiple drafts of Distribution Order and Ancillary
Matters Order and interoffice conference with A. Harmes re: same and
reviewing precedents; call with client re: distribution/tax issues; review/consider
Cassels comments on draft 2nd Report.

reviewing previous orders of Justice Conway
re: provisions related to liability on distributions.

04/26/23 KSN 1.00 Consider tax issues; call with KSV.
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Invoice No. 794999

Our File No. KSVA 230517

Page 7

April 28, 2023

Date TKID Hours Description

04/27/23 ACH 7.30 Reviewing KSV comments on Ancillary Relief Order and stay extension and
distribution Order; teleconference with Cassels and KSV re: tax and related
matters; reviewing and revising Ancillary Relief Order and Stay Extension and
Distribution Order and attending to various emails with KSV re: same; email to
Cassels re: same; reviewing Chapter 11 docket re: Plan confirmation materials;
observing Chapter 11 Plan confirmation hearing; reviewing report re: revised
Chapter 11 Plan, and drafting email re: same; attending to matters re: finalizing
Report and attending to service and related matters.

04/27/23 BON 5.90 Attention to draft Ancillary Relief Order and Stay Extension and Distribution
Order; attention to preparation for 5/1 CCAA hearing; attention to draft Second
Report of the Monitor; attention to emails/discussions re: Bread and TSA
assignment matters; attend c/c with Cassels and KSV re: Plan distribution
matters; review Amended Chapter 11 Plan; attend US Chapter 11 Plan
confirmation hearing (telephonically); attention to follow-on discussions and
matters re: same; review Cash Flow Variance Report; attention to finalization
and service of Monitor's Second Report.

04/27/23 CAG 3.70 Emails with Cassels re: US Plan matters; emails with client re: comments on
Distribution Order and Ancillary Matters Order and review and comment on
revised drafts of same and IOC with A. Harmes re: same; review amended Ch.
1 1 Plan and Confirmation Order and other Ch. 11 US filing materials; video
conference with Cassels/KSV re: distribution, tax and transaction matters; brief
initial review of draft Escrow Agreement and emails with E. Axell re: revising
Escrow Agreement; dial in to Chapter 11 Plan confirmation hearing; review DIP
variance analysis.

04/27/23 EAX 4.10 Attending Chapter 11 Plan confirmation hearing; reviewing and revising Escrow
Agreement.

04/27/23 KSN 1.40 Call re: tax issues, review and respond to emails; consider tax issues.

Total Fees $209,253.00
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Invoice No. 794999

Our File No. KSVA 230517

Summary of Professional Fees

TKID Timekeeper
Billed
HM IS

Billed
Rate

Page 8

April 28, 2023

Billed
Amount

BON O'Neill, Brendan 58.50 1,185.00 69,322.50

KSN Saddington, Kenneth 16.40 960.00 15,744.00

CAG Armstrong, Chris 34.80 915.00 31,842.00

CBES Smit, Carrie B.E. 0,80 1,400.00 1,120.00

DDC Dedic, Dan 2.90 915.00 2,653.50

MJS Sherman, Mitchell J. 0.60 1,400.00 840.00

EAX Axell, Erik 74.80 550.00 41,140.00

MHR Hassar, Michael 10.90 690.00 7,521.00

ACH Haines, Andrew 44.20 750.00 33,150.00

EVF Ferreira, Evita 7.10 760.00 5,396.00

NKA Karthikeyan, Nisheet 1.20 400.00 480.00

DPS Word Processing 0.40 110.00 44.00

Total Fees $209,253.00

Disbursements

Description Amount

Telephone - Long Distance 2.28

Copies 226.25

Computer Searches - Westlaw Carswell 638.75

Parking/ Cab / Mileage 121.87

Telephone - Cellular Phone Charges 36.00

Meals 172.59

Total Disbursements $1,197.74

Total Fees On This Invoice $209,253.00

ON HST Cl, 13.0% $27,202.89

Taxable Disbursements $1,197.74

Total Disbursements On This Invoice $1,197.74

ON HST Cr, 13.0% $155.71

Total On This Invoice (CAD) $237,809.34

Total On This Invoice (USD) $183,113.19
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Invoice No. 794999

Our File No. KSVA 230517

THIS IS OUR ACCOUNT HEREIN
GOODMANS LLP

Page 9

April 28, 2023

This invoice may not reflect all time and disbursements incurred on this matter to date. It is payable upon receipt
and in accordance with Section 33 of the Solicitors Act (Ontario), interest will be charged at the rate of 1.50% per
annum on unpaid fees, charges or disbursements calculated one month from the date this invoice is delivered.

Remittance information:

CAD Electronic Wire Payment or EFT (not e-Transfer):
Beneficiary Bank: TD Canada Trust, 394 Bay Street, Toronto, ON M5H 2Y3
Beneficiary Account Name: Goodmans LLP
Beneficiary Address: 333 Bay Street, Suite 3400, Toronto, Ontario M5H 2S7
Bank ID (for wire payments): 004 Bank ID (for EFT payments): 0004
Transit: 12162 Swift code: TDOMCATTTOR
CAD account: 0552488

USD Electronic Wire Payment:
Beneficiary Bank: TD Canada Trust, 394 Bay Street, Toronto, ON M5H 2Y3
Beneficiary Account name: Goodmans LLP
Beneficiary Address: 333 Bay Street, Suite 3400, Toronto, Ontario M5H 2S7
Bank ID (for wire payments): 004 Transit: 12162
USD account: 7359751 Swift code: TDOMCATTTOR
Intermediary Bank: Bank of America, New York, NY, USA
ABA: 026009593 Swift code: BOFAUS3NXXX

Email payment details, including invoice #, matter # and amount paid, to: collections@goodmans.ca

Cheques or Bank draft payable to: Goodmans LLP
Send to: Goodmans LLP, 333 Bay Street, Suite 3400, Toronto, Ontario M5H 2S7

Please enclose remittance copy including invoice #, matter # and amount paid.
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Good ma

May 17, 2023

Our File No.: 230517

KSV Advisory Inc.
1300 — 220 Bay Street
Toronto, ON M5J 2W4

Attention: Noah Goldstein 

Dear Noah:

Re: Project Loyalty 

Please find enclosed our account for services rendered with respect to the
the period up to and including May 15, 2023.

I trust you will find the enclosed to be in order. If you have any questions
please do not hesitate to contact me.

Yours very truly,

GOODMANS LLP

Brendan O'Neill
BO/oa
Encl.

7372662

Barristers & Solicitors

Bay Adelaide Centre
333 Bay Street, Suite 3400
Toronto, Ontario M5H 2S7

Telephone: 416.979.2211
Facsimile: 416,979.1234
goodmans.ca

Direct Line: 416.849.6017
boneill@goodmans.ca

above noted matter for

regarding the enclosed,

104



Goodmang

KSV Advisory Inc.
1300 - 220 Bay St
Toronto, ON M5J 2W4
Canada

Attention: Noah Goldstein

Re: Project Loyalty

Barristers & Solicitors

Bay Adelaide Centre
333 Bay Street, Suite 3400
Toronto, Ontario M5H 2S7

Telephone: 416.979.2211
Facsimile: 416.979.1234
good mans.ca

GST Registration Number R119422962

May 17, 2023

Our File No. KSVA 230517

Invoice No. 795789

To our professional services rendered in connection with the above noted matter:

Date TKID Hours Description

04/27/23 KSN 1.50 Telephone conference with Cassels Brock and FSU; considering tax issues;
reviewing and responding to emails.

04/28/23 ACH 5.00 Reviewing and revising Escrow Agreement and related transaction documents;
reviewing affidavit re: sale approval hearing.

04/28/23 BON 3.30 Attend bi-weekly update call with Cassels and KSV; attention to draft BMO
Escrow Agreement; attention to t/cs with Cassels re: discussions with
Stikemans; attend c/c with Stikemans re: Bread objections and scheduling
matters re: same.

04/28/23 CAG 1.80 Review successful bid letter; brief review and comment on Escrow Agreement
and instructions to E. Axell re: revising and precedent escrow agreements; status

update with Cassels/KSV/PJT; emails re: Bread litigation schedule.

04/28/23 EAX 8.30 Reviewin and revisin Escrow A reement•

04/29/23 ACH 4.00 Reviewing revised orders and drafting email re: same; reviewing and providing

comments on affidavit re: sale approval hearing.

04/29/23 BON 2.40 Attention to draft AVO, ARO, SEDO, Assignment Order and Affidavit for

5/12/2023 hearing; internal emails/discussions re: same.

04/29/23 CAG 2.30 Review and comment on revised form of AVO, 11.3 Order and sale approval

affidavit and emails with internal team re: same.

04/29/23 EAX 1.30 Reviewing Approval and Vesting Order against model order and running

blacklines on various orders.

04/30/23 ACH 3.00 Revising orders and drafting email to KSV re: points for discussion; reviewing

comments on Escrow Agreement and drafting email re: same.

04/30/23 BON 3.40 Attention to draft AVO, ARO, SEDO, Assignment Order and Affidavit for

5/12/2023 hearing; internal emails/discussions re: same; attention to draft
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Invoice No. 795789

Our File No. KSVA 230517

Date

04/30/23

04/30/23

05/01/23

05/01/23

05/01/23

05/01/23

05/02/23

05/02/23

05/02/23

05/02/23

05/02/23

05/02/23

05/03/23

TKID Hours

CAG 1.60

EAX 2.10

ACH 6.00

BON 6.30

CAG 5.50

EAX 4.80

ACH 5.00

BON 3.20

CAG 3.10

EAX 5.20

EVF 1.70

KSN 0.50

ACH 8.10

Page 2

May 17, 2023

Description

Escrow Agreement and emails/discussions re: same.

Review and comment on revised forms of Ancillary Relief Order and
Distribution Order and emails with internal team re: same; reviewing and
comment on revised Escrow Agreement and emails re: same.

Reviewing and revising Escrow Agreement.

Teleconference with KSV re: sale approval materials; reviewing and revising
same and drafting email to Cassels; reviewing revised Court materials, and
teleconference with KSV and Cassels; attending Court hearing re: US plan
Recognition Order.

Attention to draft AVO, ARO, SEDO, Assignment Order and Affidavit for
5/12/2023 hearing; c/c with KSV re: same; attention to draft Escrow Agreement
and emails/discussions re: same; prepare for 5/1 CCAA hearing re: Canadian US
Plan Implementation Order; attend 5/1 CCAA hearing re: US Plan
Implementation Order; review Endorsement re: 5/1 CCAA Order; attend internal
c/c re: TMA matters and analysis re: same; review and discuss revised versions
of draft AVO, ARO, SEDO, Assigmuent Order and Affidavit from Cassels; c/c
with Cassels and KSV re: same.

Telephone call with client re: outstanding issues on AVO, Ancillary Order and
Distribution Order; prepare for and attend hearing re: US plan matters approval;
review/circulate endorsement and order of Court to client; reviewing and
commenting on revised drafts of AVO, Ancillary Order and Distribution Order
and telephone call with Cassels and KSV re: same and status of various other
case matters;

Telephone conference with KSV re: sale approval materials; attending hearing

for auuroval of US planperformance;

approval of US plan performance.

Reviewing revised APA; reviewing revised orders and attending to email
correspondence re: same; reviewing draft Third Report of the Monitor and
providing comments on same.

Attention to revised APA and APA amendment and internal
emails/discussions/comments re: same; attention to revised versions of AVO,
ARO and Assignment Order and emails/discussions re: same.

Review and comment on BMO APA amendments updated turns of ARO and
Distribution Order, considering issues re: same and multiple entails with internal
team, KSV and Cassels re: same.

Reviewing revised APA and APA amendment; providing comments on same.

Reviewing agreement amendments; reviewing and responding to entails.

Reviewing chart re: key dates and deliverables in Stalking Horse Agreement and
providing comments re: same; reviewing acknowledgement agreement and
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05/03/23 BON 3.90

05/03/23 CAG 4.30

05/03/23 EAX 7.10

05/04/23 BON 0.50

05/04/23 CAG 0.60

05/04/23 EAX 2.60

05/05/23 BON 3.90

05/05/23 CAG 2.70

05/05/23 EAX 1.50

05/06/23 BON 1.10

05/06/23 CAG 0.30

05/07/23 BON 0.80

05/07/23 CAG 0.30

05/08/23 ACH 1.80

05/08/23 BON 0.80

05/08/23 CAG 0.80

Invoice No. 795789

Our File No. KSVA 230517

Date TKID Hours Description

email correspondence re: same; reviewing amendment to Purchase Agreement
and schedules re: same; reviewing and revising draft Monitor's Report;
teleconference with Cassels re: Ancillary Relief Order; reviewing email
correspondence re: same.

Attention to draft Third Report of the Monitor; attention to revised Ancillary
Order, BMO APA, APA Amendment and APA Schedules and discussions with
KSV and Cassels re: same.

Telephone call with Cassels re: outstanding issues re: ARO and other motion
matters; brief review of mark-up of notice motion; review and comment on
updated APA Amendment and reviewing APA contract schedules; review and
comment on updated version of draft Monitor's 3rd Report; review/consider
AVO release matters and telephone call with Cassels re: same.

Page 3

May 17, 2023

Reviewin arnd revisingthe Monitor's Third Re of

Attention to discussions with Cassels re: various Bread matters.

Emails re: Bread case conference; IOC with K. Saddington re: various tax
matters.

Attention to various calls and emails re: Bread matters; attention to draft Bread
acknowledgement for 5/12 hearing and emails/discussions re: same; attention to
draft Third Report of the Monitor.

Review LVI intercompany services agreements; attend call with Cassels and
Stikeman re: Bread issues; comments on Monitor's Report; emails with client re:
Bread matters; attend follow up call with Stikeman and Cassels re: Bread issues
and emails with Cassels and client re: same; review/consider email from Disney
counsel re: contract assignments.

Attention to emails/discussions with Stikemans and Cassels re: Bread
acknowledgements re: 5/12 hearing; attention to Cassels comments to draft
Third Report of the Monitor.

Email correspondence with Cassels, Stikeman and client re: Bread
issues/Monday case conference.

Attention to emails/discussions with Stikemans and Cassels re: Bread
acknowledgements re: 5/12 hearing and vacating 5/8 case conference.

Email correspondence with Cassels, Stikeman and client re: Bread
issues/Monday case conference.

Reviewing and finalizing Third Report; attending to matters re: service.

Attention to revised draft Ancillary Order; attention to final revisions re: Third
Report of the Monitor.

Review Cassels comments on 3rd report and emails with KSV re: finalization of
same; telephone call with Cassels re: lease disclaimer matters.
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Invoice No. 795789

Our File No. KSVA 230517

Date TKID Hours Description

05/08/23 EAX 4.30

Page 4

May 17, 2023

05/09/23 ACH 3.50 Reviewing and providing comments on draft factum; revising same.

05/09/23 BON 3.40 Attention to emails/discussions re: assignment of Disney contracts; attend c/c
with KSV re: lease disclaimer process and timing; attention to draft Factum for
5/12 CCAA hearing.

05/09/23 CAG 2.80 Review and comment on revised ARO and emails with Cassels/KSV re: same;
emails with Cassels re: landlord issues; telephone call with KSV re: landlord
matters/proposed course of action; brief review of lease materials and interoffice
conference and emails with E. Axell re: review/summary of lease information;
review and comment on Ll factum for AVO etc. hearing and interoffice
conference with A. Haines re: same.

05/09/23 EAX 5.90 Telephone call with KSV re: lease disclaimers; reviewing/analyzing leases;
creating chart summarizing key provisions re: furniture fixtures and equipment;
drafting email to KSV re: same.

05/10/23 BON 1.20 Review BMO Factum and other filings for 5/12 CCAA hearing.

05/10/23 EAX 5.30

05/10/23 KSN 0.90 Consider tax issues.

05/11/23 BON 2.40 Attention to preparations for 5/12 CCAA hearing; attention to emails/discussions
and documents re: Montreal, Calgary and Vancouver lease disclaimers; attention
to APA section 8.15(a) notice to BMO; attention to A&M Variance Report.

05/11/23 CAG 1.40

05/11/23 EAX 5.50

reviewmgianaiyzmg leases.

05/11/23 NKA 0.30 Drafting chart for tracking disclaimers issued under CCAA proceedings.

05/12/23 ACH 2.00 Attending hearing re: sale approval.

05/12/23 BON 2.50 Attention to revised ancillary order; attention to emails/discussions re: potential
hearing issues; attend CCAA hearing re: AVO, Ancillary Order and Assignment
Order.

05/12/23 CAG 4.70 Prepare for and attend hearing re: transaction approval, 11.3 Order and Ancillary
Relief and reporting email to client; review endorsement of Conway J and
circulating to client.

Numerous emails with KSV and Cassels re: lease disclaimer matters and
reviewing lease disclaimer notices; reviewing materials in preparation for sale
approval hearing; review revised forms of Order.

05/12/23 EAX 2.70

Total Fees $140,010.50
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Invoice No. 795789

Our File No. KSVA 230517

Summary of Professional Fees

TKID Timekeeper
Billed
Hours

Billed
Rate

Page 5

May 17, 2023

Billed
Amount

BON O'Neill, Brendan 39.10 1,185.00 46,333.50

CAG Armstrong, Chris 32.20 915.00 29,463.00

KSN Saddington, Kenneth 2.90 960.00 2,784.00

EAX Axell, Erik 56.60 550.00 31,130.00

ACH Harmes, Andrew 38.40 750.00 28,800.00

EVF Ferreira, Evita 1.70 760.00 1,292.00

NKA Karthikeyan, Nisheet 0.30 400.00 120.00

DPS Word Processing 0.80 110.00 88.00

Total Fees $140,010.50

Disbursements

Description Amount

Copies 336.75

Total Disbursements $336.75

Total Fees On This Invoice $140,010.50

ON HST @ 13.0% $18,201.36

Taxable Disbursements $336.75

Total Disbursements On This Invoice $336.75

ON HST @ 13.0% $43.78

Total On This Invoice (CAD) $158,592.39

THIS IS OUR ACCOUNT HEREIN
GOODMANS LLP

E. & O. E.
BON/

This invoice may not reflect all time and disbursements incurred on this matter to date. It is payable upon receipt

and in accordance with Section 33 of the Solicitors Act (Ontario), interest will be charged at the rate of 1.50% per

annum on unpaid fees, charges or disbursements calculated one month from the date this invoice is delivered.
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Invoice No. 795789

Our File No. KSVA 230517

Page 6

May 17, 2023

Remittance information:

CAD Electronic Wire Payment or EFT (not e-Transfer):
Beneficiary Bank: TD Canada Trust, 394 Bay Street, Toronto, ON M5H 2Y3
Beneficiary Account Name: Goodmans LLP
Beneficiary Address: 333 Bay Street, Suite 3400, Toronto, Ontario M5H 2S7
Bank ID (for wire payments): 004 Bank ID (for EFT payments): 0004
Transit: 12162 Swift code: TDOMCATTTOR
CAD account: 0552488

USD Electronic Wire Payment:
Beneficiary Bank: TD Canada Trust, 394 Bay Street, Toronto, ON M5H 2Y3
Beneficiary Account name: Goodmans LLP
Beneficiary Address: 333 Bay Street, Suite 3400, Toronto, Ontario M5H 2S7
Bank ID (for wire payments): 004 Transit: 12162
USD account: 7359751 Swift code: TDOMCATTTOR
Intermediary Bank: Bank of America, New York, NY, USA
ABA: 026009593 Swift code: BOFAUS3NXXX

Email payment details, including invoice #, matter # and amount paid, to: collections@goodmans.ca

Cheques or Bank draft payable to: Goodmans LLP
Send to: Goodmans LLP, 333 Bay Street, Suite 3400, Toronto, Ontario M5H 2S7
Please enclose remittance copy including invoice #, matter # and amount paid.
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Goo mans

June 6, 2023

Our File No.: 230517

KSV Advisory Inc.
1300 — 220 Bay Street
Toronto, ON M5J 2W4

Attention: Noah Goldstein 

Dear Noah:

Re: Project Loyalty 

Please find enclosed our account for services rendered with respect to the
the period up to and including June 5, 2023.

I trust you will find the enclosed to be in order. If you have any questions
please do not hesitate to contact me.

Yours very truly,

GOODMANS LLP

Brendan O'Neill
BO/oa
Encl.

7383406

Barristers & Solicitors

Bay Adelaide Centre
333 Bay Street, Suite 3400
Toronto, Ontario M5H 2S7

Telephone: 416.979.2211
Facsimile: 416.979.1234
goodmans.ca

Direct Line: 416.849.6017
boneill@goodmans.ca

above noted matter for

regarding the enclosed,
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oodman .

KSV Advisory Inc.
1300 - 220 Bay St
Toronto, ON M5J 2W4
Canada

Attention: Noah Goldstein

Re: Project Loyalty

Barristers & Solicitors

Bay Adelaide Centre
333 Bay Street, Suite 3400
Toronto, Ontario M5H 2S7

Telephone: 416.979.2211
Facsimile: 416.979.1234
goodmans.ca

GST Registration Number 8119422962

June 6, 2023

Our File No. KSVA 230517

Invoice No. 796919

To our professional services rendered in connection with the above noted matter:

Date TKID Hours

05/04/23 KSN 1.40

05/15/23 EAX 4.40

05/16/23 ACH 0.50

05/16/23 BON 1.90

05/16/23 CAG 0.60

05/16/23 EAX 1.90

05/17/23 ACH 2.50

05/17/23 EAX 2.10

05/18/23 ACH 5.00

05/18/23 BON 1.80

05/18/23 CAG 0.80

05/18/23 EAX 4.10

Description

Consider tax issues; review and respond to emails.

Videoconference with Cassels and KSV re: update on CCAA matters.

Attention to revised draft of Escrow A •eement; attend u call call with Cassels
and KSV; attention to draft Waterfall:

Attend status update call with Cassels/KSV/A&M; emails with Cassels re: lease
disclaimer matters.

Reviewing and revising Escrow Agreement.

Reviewing Escrow Agreement; meeting to discuss same.

Reviewing and revising Escrow Agreement.

Revising Escrow Agreement; drafting email re: same; reviewing Purchase

Agreement re: joint direction mechanics; drafting email re: same; email to KSV
re: Escrow Agreement; telephone call with stakeholder counsel; email to KSV
re: Agency Agreement.

Attention to draft Escrow Agreement; review latest cash flow report; attention to

emails/discussions re: Bounteous matters; attention to emails/discussions re:

scheduling matters for July 5 distribution motion.

Review/consider revised version of Escrow Agreement and interoffice

conference with A. Mimes re: revisions to same; review emails re: Bouneous

and RLG matters.
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Invoice No.

Our File No.

796919

KSVA 230517

Page 2

June 6, 2023

Date TKID Hours Description

05/19/23 ACH 1.00 Email to Cassels re: treatment of Agency Agreement; email to KSV re: Escrow
Agreement.

05/19/23 BON 2.30 Attention to draft Escrow Agreement; attention to emails/discussions re: RMG
Agency Agreement matters; attention to emails/discussions and correspondence
re: Bounteous Canada; attention to emails/discussions re: various BMO deal
closing points (changes to cash management system; changes to business names;
etc); attention to draft Assignment and Assumption Agreement re: Reserve

05/19/23 CAG 0.20

Agreement,

Emails with client re: Escrow Agreement.

05/19/23 EAX 1.90
reviewing, revising and distributing Escrow Agreement for comments.

05/20/23 BON 0.60 Review Torys revisions to Escrow Agreement; attention to emails/discussions
re: same.

05/20/23 CAG 0.60 Review and comment on Reserve Agreement assignment, cash management
modifications and business name change matter and emails with Monitor and
Cassels re: same.

05/20/23 DDC 0.40 Reviewing assignment and assumption re: reserve account; correspondence.

05/21/23 ACH 1.50 Reviewing email correspondence re: Escrow Agreement; reviewing precedent
escrow agreements re: survival of indemnity; drafting email re: same.

05/21/23 BON 0.40 Attention to emails/discussions re: Escrow Agreement precedents.

05/23/23 ACH 3.20 Email re: survival of indemnity; reviewing precedent indemnity agreements and
drafting chart re: same; videoconference with Cassels and KSV re: update;
reviewing closing documents and closing checklist.

05/23/23 BON 1.30 Attention to various BMO closing documents; attention to draft BMO Escrow
Agreement and emails/discussions with Torys re: same.

05/23/23 CAG 1.10 Attend status update call with Cassels, KSV and A&M re: various closing
matters; review Torys comments on Escrow Agreement and emails from A.
Harmes re: precedent escrow agreements and responding to Torys.

05/23/23 EAX 3.40 Reviewing, analyzing and editing Assignment and Assumption Agreement,
Officer's Certificate, Resignation and Release Agreement, Termination
Agreement, Share Transfer Authorization and Conditions Certificate in advance
of closing.

05/24/23 ACH 5.00 Reviewing and providing comments on draft closing documentation; attending
to various email correspondence re: same.

05/24/23 BON 1.20 Attention to various BMO closing documents and emails/discussions and
revisions re: same.

05/24/23 CAG 2.70 Emails re: closing documents; attending to matters re: Escrow Agreement and

emails with Torys re: same; emails re: landlord matters and reviewing

correspondence from landlord; review and comment on DIP payout and flow of

funds; telephone call with LI and Cassels re: Toronto office issues and books

and records and reporting email to client re: same.

05/24/23 DDC 0.40 Reviewing DIP payout letter and flow of funds; correspondence with A. Harmes.
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Date

796919

KSVA

TKID

230517

Hours

05/24/23 EAX 3.80

05/24/23 EVF 0.10

05/24/23 KSN 0.80

05/25/23 ACH 0.50

05/25/23 BON 1.40

05/25/23 CAG 1.10

05/25/23 EAX 1.20

05/25/23 KSN 0.50

05/26/23 ACH 4.00

05/26/23 BON 2.40

05/26/23 CAG 2.30

05/26/23 DDC 0.50

05/26/23 EAX 0.50

05/26/23 EAX 3.80

05/27/23 CAG 0.50

05/28/23 ACH 2.50

05/28/23 BON 0.40

05/28/23 CAG 0.50

05/29/23 ACH 2.50

Page 3

June 6, 2023

Description

Teleconference call with A. Harmes re: transaction documents.

Review allocation; review and respond to emails; consider tax issues.

Email to Cassels re: flow of funds and DIP payout letter.

Attention to various BMO closing documents and emails/discussions re: same.

Emails with client and Cassels re: Toronto premises/FF&E; brief review of Iron
Mountain books and records list and emails with Cassels and internal team re:
same; interoffice conference with E. Axell re: review of Iron Mountain list; brief
review of additional closing documents and internal emails with team re:
reviewing same.

Reviewing and commenting on Monitor's certiifcate and IP assignment
agreements.

Consider tax issues; review and respond to emails.

Reviewing closing documents; email to KSV re: same; email to Cassels re:
comments on same; teleconference with Cassels re: update.

EAttention to various BMO closing documents (including Amendment #2 to
APA and Assignment and Assumption of Reserve Fund Agreement) and
emails/discussions re: same; attend update call with Cassels and KSV; attention
to discussions, analysis and document review re: Oracle contracts; attention to
emails/discussions and draft FOF documents re: cure cost payment mechanics.

Review comments on various closing documents and emails with internal team
re: revisions to same; review cure costs schedule and updated flow of funds and
emails with internal team re: same; attend update call with Cassels and KSV re:
status of closing; reviewing APA re: Oracle contract matters and emails with
internal team and Cassels re: same; review revised version of Reserve
Assignment Agreement and emails with Cassels re: same.

Reviewing APA and closing matters.

Telephone call with KSV re: closing mechanics and Oracle Agreement.

Reviewing LoyaltyOne records held by Iron Mountain for organizational, legal

and tax documents that are required to be kept by KSV.

Review 2nd Amendment to APA and emails with internal team and Cassels re:
same; consider issues re: Oracle and emails with KSV re: same.

Reviewing disclaimers; drafting email to KSV re: same.

Attention to emails/discussions and documents re: draft contract disclaimer

notice.

Reviewing email from Cassels re: disclaimer of contracts and brief sample

review of disclaimer letters and contracts to disclaim.

Attending to various emails and other correspondence re: disclaimers; reviewing

revised disclaimers; email to KSV re: Monitor's certificate; email to Torys re:

Escrow Agreement.
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Page 4

June 6, 2023

Date TKID Hours Description

05/29/23 BON 1.20 Attention to various closing documents and matters and emails/discussions with
KSV and Cassels re: same; attention to emails/discussions and analysis re: draft
contract disclaimers.

05/29/23 CAG 1.60 Review and comment on revised APA, Contract schedules, flow of funds and
purchase price estimate and multiple emails with KSV/Cassels re: same.

05/29/23 DDC 0.30 Correspondence re: APA, funds flow and closing matters.

05/30/23 ACH 4.00 Attending to various matters re: disclaimers; telephone call with Cassels re:
Oracle; discussing same; teleconference with Cassels and KSV; email re:
Monitor powers; reviewing Oracle agreements and providing comments on
same; attending to various closing matters.

05/30/23 BON 3.10 Attention to various closing matters and documents and emails/discussions with
KSV and Cassels re: same; attention to emails/discussions and documents re:
Oracle contract matters; attend update c/c with Cassels and KSV; attention to
closing agenda script; attention to emails/discussions with Cassels and KSV re:
para 5 of Ancillary Relief Order matters.

05/30/23 CAG 2.70 Review/consider Cassels responses to questions on revised schedules and
various closing documents and emails with KSV re: same; numerous emails and
telephone conferences with Cassels/KSV/Torys/internal team re: various closing
matters, contract disclaimer matters and Oracle assignment matters.

05/30/23 EAX 1.60 Telephone call with KSV re: closing mechanics and Oracle Agreement; updating
tracking list of disclaimed contracts.

05/30/23 KSN 2.50 Review Purchase Agreement; consider tax issues.

05/31/23 ACH 4.00 Reviewing Purchase Agreement amendment and revised closing documents;
attending to matters re: closing; attending to closing call; attending to various
matters re: timing for issuance of Monitor's certificate; issuing Monitor's
certificate.

05/31/23 BON 2.40 Attention to various BMO closing documents and matters; attend BMO closing
call; attention to final closing mechanics and matters.

05/31/23 CAG 0.70 Emails with KSV/Cassels/Torys/internal team and telephone call with A.
Harmes re: various closing and disclaimer matters.

05/31/23 DDC 0.20 Correspondence re: APA matters.

05/31/23 KSN 1.00 Review Purchase Agreement; consider tax issues.

05/31/23 MJS 0.50 Consider issues relating to structure; review prior comfort letter precedents.

06/01/23 ACH 2.00 Reviewing Assignment Agreement re: bank accounts; attending to email
correspondence re: same; reviewing disclaimers; attending to various matters re:
Monitor's certificate filing.

06/01/23 BON 0.90 Attention to draft post-closing documents and emails/discussions re: same;
attention to contract disclaimers; attention to bank account assignments.

06/01/23 CAG 0.40 Emails with KSV/Cassels/internal team re: closing matters, disclaimers and bank
account matters.

06/01/23 EAX 3.50 Reviewing and commenting on notice of disclaimers; updating tracking chart of
disclaimers.
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Date TKID Hours Description

06/02/23 EAX 1.80 Research re:

Page 5

June 6, 2023

; drafting memo re: same.

Total Fees $95,422.50

Summary of Professional Fees

Billed Billed Billed
TKID Timekeeper Hours Rate Amount

KSN Saddington, Kenneth 6.20 960.00 5,952.00

CAG Armstrong, Chris 15.80 915.00 14,457.00

BON O'Neill, Brendan 21.30 1,185.00 25,240.50

DDC Dedic, Dan 1.80 915.00 1,647.00

MJS Sherman, Mitchell J. 0.50 1,400.00 700.00

EAX Axell, Erik 34.00 550.00 18,700.00

ACH Harmes, Andrew 38.20 750.00 28,650.00

EVF Ferreira, Evita 0.10 760.00 76.00

Total Fees $95,422.50

Disbursements

Description Amount

Computer Searches - Westlaw Carswell 59.25

Parking/ Cab / Mileage 57.14

Meals 27.14

Delivery - Courier 79.79

Total Disbursements $223.32

Total Fees On This Invoice $95,422.50

ON HST @ 13.0% $12,404.93

Taxable Disbursements $223.32

Total Disbursements On This Invoice $223.32

ON HST @ 13.0% $29.03

Total On This Invoice (CAD) $108,079.78
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Invoice No. 796919

Our File No. KSVA 230517

THIS IS OUR ACCOUNT HEREIN
GOODMANS LLP

E. & O. E.
BON/

Page 6

June 6, 2023

This invoice may not reflect all time and disbursements incurred on this matter to date. It is payable upon receipt
and in accordance with Section 33 of the Solicitors Act (Ontario), interest will be charged at the rate of 1.50% per
annum on unpaid fees, charges or disbursements calculated one month from the date this invoice is delivered.

Remittance information:

CAD Electronic Wire Payment or EFT (not e-Transfer):
Beneficiary Bank: TD Canada Trust, 394 Bay Street, Toronto, ON M5H 2Y3
Beneficiary Account Name: Goodmans LLP
Beneficiary Address: 333 Bay Street, Suite 3400, Toronto, Ontario M5H 2S7
Bank ID (for wire payments): 004 Bank ID (for EFT payments): 0004
Transit: 12162 Swift code: TDOMCATTTOR
CAD account: 0552488

USD Electronic Wire Payment:
Beneficiary Bank: TD Canada Trust, 394 Bay Street, Toronto, ON M5H 2Y3
Beneficiary Account name: Goodmans LLP
Beneficiary Address: 333 Bay Street, Suite 3400, Toronto, Ontario M5H 2S7
Bank ID (for wire payments): 004 Transit: 12162
USD account: 7359751 Swift code: TDOMCATTTOR
Intermediary Bank: Bank of America, New York, NY, USA
ABA: 026009593 Swift code: BOFAUS3NXXX

Email payment details, including invoice #, matter # and amount paid, to: collections@goodnlans.ca

Cheques or Bank draft payable to: Goodmans LLP

Send to: Goodmans LLP, 333 Bay Street, Suite 3400, Toronto, Ontario M5H 2S7

Please enclose remittance copy including invoice #, matter # and amount paid.
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THIS IS EXHIBIT "B"
TO THE AFFIDAVIT OF CHRISTOPHER ARMSTRONG
SWORN BEFORE ME THIS 27th DAY OF JUNE, 2023

E 4,t 74X,
Commissioner for Taking Affidavits
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THIS IS EXHIBIT "C"
TO THE AFFIDAVIT OF CHRISTOPHER ARMSTRONG
SWORN BEFORE ME THIS 27th DAY OF JUNE, 2023

Commissioner for Taking Affidavits
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KSV Advisory Inc.
Summary of Activity by Goodmans LLP Professionals

Professional Year of Call Average
Hourly Rate

Total Hours

O'Neill, Brendan 2000 $1,185.00 204.0

Axe11, Erik 2022 $550.00 179.6

Hannes, Andrew 2017 $750.00 172.6

Armstrong, Chris 2008 $915.00 160.3

Saddington, Kenneth 2011 960.0 29.5

Dedic, Dan 2010 $915.00 25.3

Ferreira, Evita 2016 $760.00 23.0

Hassar, Michael 2020 $690.00 10.9

Fazli, Nargis 2021 $600.00 4.0
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KSV Advisory Inc.
Summary of Activity by Goodmans LLP Professionals

Professional Year of Call Average
Hourly Rate

Total Hours

Word Processing Word
Processing

$110.00 2.1

Rosner, David 2006 $1,150.00 1.8

Karthikeyan, Nisheet Articling
Student

$400.00 1.5

Sherman, Mitchell J. 1989 $1,400.00 1.1

Bunting, Amanda Law Clerk $315.00 0.9

Smit, Carrie B.E. 1992 $1,400.00 0.8

Kolla, Peter 2007 $915.00 0.6

Ernst, Glenn S. 1990 $1,265.00 0.4

Total Hours 818.4

Average Hourly Rate ($ Billed / Hours Billed) 858.28
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7389926 
 

IN THE MATTER OF THE COMPANIES’ CREDITORS ARRANGEMENT ACT, R.S.C. 1985, c. C-36, AS 
AMENDED 

AND IN THE MATTER OF A PLAN OF COMPROMISE OR ARRANGEMENT OF LOYALTYONE, CO.  

Court File No.:  CV-23-00696017-00CL 

  
  
 

ONTARIO 
SUPERIOR COURT OF JUSTICE 

COMMERCIAL LIST 

PROCEEDING COMMENCED AT 
TORONTO 

FOURTH REPORT OF THE MONITOR 
(June 27, 2023) 

Goodmans LLP 
333 Bay Street, Suite 3400 
Toronto, ON   M5H 2S7 

Brendan O’Neill LSO#: 43331J 
boneill@goodmans.ca 

Christopher Armstrong LSO#: 55148B 
carmstrong@goodmans.ca 

Andrew Harmes LSO#: 73221A 
aharmes@goodmans.ca 

Lawyers for KSV Restructuring Inc.  
as CCAA Monitor of LoyaltyOne, Co. 
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